John Harabedian, Mayor

John Capoccia, Mayor Pro Tem
Rachelle Arizmendi, Council Member
Denise Delmar, Council Member
Gene Goss, Council Member

AGENDA
CITY COUNCIL MEETING

Tuesday, October 22, 2019 Sue Spears, City Clerk

6:30 PM Michael Amerio, City Treasurer

City Hall Council Chambers
232 W. Sierra Madre Boulevard
Sierra Madre, California 91024

CALL TO ORDER/ROLL CALL MEMBERS OF THE CITY COUNCIL:
Mayor Harabedian, Mayor Pro Tem Capoccia, Council Member Arizmendi, Council Member Delmar, and
Council Member Goss

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND INSPIRATION:
Council Member Gene Goss.

APPROVAL OF MEETING AGENDA:
Vote of the Council to proceed with City business.

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL REPORTS:
Reporting of Council Member activities related to City business.

PUBLIC COMMENT:

The Council will listen to the public on any item on the agenda. Under the Brown Act, Council is prohibited from
taking action on items not on the agenda, but the matter may be referred to staff or to a subsequent meeting. Each
speaker will be limited to three continuous minutes, which may not be delegated. These rules will be enforced but
may be changed by appropriate City Council action.

PUBLIC COMMENT FOR ITEMS ON THE AGENDA:

Persons wishing to speak on any item on the agenda will be called at the time the agenda item is brought forward.
Persons wishing to speak on closed session items have a choice of doing so either immediately prior to the closed
session or at the time for comments on items at the open session.

PRESENTATIONS

Presentation to Sierra Madre Little League in Congratulations for their Championship Win
Presentation in recognition of Retiring Fire Captain Greg Christmas
Update from Sierra Madre CERT

Recognition of Council Member Denise Delmar for her service to the Community of Sierra Madre




ACTION ITEMS

CONSENT

a)

b)

d)

SECOND READING OF ORDINANCE 1416 — ADOPTION OF THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE

Staff recommends that the City Council introduce and approve for Second reading by title only,
and waive further reading, recommending adoption of Ordinance 1416 pursuant to the 2019
California Building Standards Code amendments

SECOND READING OF ORDINANCE 1417 - ADOPTION OF THE 2019 FIRE CODE

Staff recommends that the City Council introduce and approve for second reading Ordinance 1417 by title
only, recommending adoption of Ordinance 1417 pursuant to the 2019 California Fire Code and
International Fire Code amendments.

TREASURERS REPORT- QUARTER ENDING JUNE 30, 2019.

Staff recommends that the City Council receive and file the Treasurer's Report- Quarter Ending June 30,
2019

AWARD THE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT TO WEST AND ASSOCIATES FOR
ENGINEERING DESIGN SERVICES FOR THE DESIGN OF FY 2019-20 STREET
IMPROVEMENTS

Staff recommends that the City Council award a professional services contract to West and Associates
Engineering INC. for engineering design service in the amount of $45,500 and authorize City Manager or
their designee to execute the Professional Services Agreement with said firm.

ADOPTION OF RESOLUTION 19-54 OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SIERRA
MADRE APPROVING CERTAIN DEMANDS

Recommendation that the City Council approve Resolution 19-54 for approval of payment of City
warrants in the aggregate amount of $979,730.07; Sierra Madre Library warrants in an aggregate amount
of $3,929.60; and payroll transfer in the aggregate amount of $355,105.61 for the fiscal year ending June
30, 20109.

DISCUSSION

1.

WATERWORKS AMENITY IMPROVEMENTS

Staff recommends the City Council authorize expenditures on amenity improvements not to exceed
$40,000.

MASTER LEASE AGREEMENT WITH TOWERPOINT CAPITAL, LLC, FOR THE SALE OF
LEASE INTEREST IN WIRELESS COMMUNICATION SITES ON CITY PROPERTY

Staff recommends the City Council execute the letter of intent with TowerPoint Capital, LLC for the
exclusive option to purchase lease interest in wireless communication sites on City property, and adopt
resolution 19-55, a resolution of the City Council of the City of Sierra Madre, California, authorizing the
Mayor to execute master lease agreements and other necessary documents for the assignment of certain
specified telecommunications leases to TPA I1I, LLC.




3. CONSIDERATION OF ADOPTING RESOLUTION 19-56 AMENDING THE CITY’S TUITION
REIMBURSEMENT PROGRAM AND EDUCATIONAL COSTS ASSISTANCE PROGRAM
POLICY

Staff recommends the City Council adopt Resolution 19-56 amending the proposed Tuition Reimbursement
Program and Educational Costs Assistance Program policy.

4. OPTIONS FOR FILLING CITY COUNCIL VACANCY

Staff recommends that the City Council provide staff with direction.

ACTION ITEMS
Regardless of staff recommendation on any agenda item, the City Council will consider such matters,
including action to approve, conditionally approve, reject, or continue such item.

AVAILABILITY OF AGENDA MATERIALS

Materials related to items on this agenda are available for public inspection on the City’s website at
www.cityofsierramadre.com, and during normal business hours at City Hall, 232 W. Sierra Madre Blvd.
and at the Sierra Madre Public Library, 440 W. Sierra Madre Blvd.

LIVE BROADCASTS
Regular City Council meetings are broadcasted live on Cable Channel 3 and rebroadcast on Wednesday
and Saturday at 5:30 p.m.

MEETING ASSISTANCE
If you require special assistance to participate in this meeting, please call the City Manager’s office at (626)
355-7135 at least 48 hours prior to the meeting.

ADJOURNMENT
The City Council will adjourn to a Public Hearing at this same place on NOVEMBER 12, 20109.




John Harabedian, Mayor

John Capoccia, Mayor Pro Tem
Rachelle Arizmendi, Council Member
Denise Delmar, Council Member
Gene Goss, Council Member

City of Sierra Madre

Sue Spears, City Clerk,

Agenda Report Michael Amerio City Treasurer
TO: Honorable Mayor Harabedian and Members of the City Council
FROM: James Guerra, Building Official
REVIEWED BY: Gabriel Engeland, City Manager
DATE: October 22, 2019
SUBJECT: SECOND READING OF ORDINANCE 1416 — ADOPTION OF THE

2019 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

STAFEF RECOMMENDATION

Staff recommends Alternative No. 1 that the City Council introduce and approve for Second
reading by title only, and waive further reading, recommending adoption of Ordinance 1416
pursuant to the 2019 California Building Standards Code amendments

ALTERNATIVES
1. Introduce and approve for second reading by title only, and waive further reading
Ordinance 1416, and direct the City Attorney to prepare a summary ordinance.

2. Introduce and approve for second reading by title only, and waive further reading
Ordinance 1416 as amended by the City Council, and direct the City Attorney to prepare
a summary ordinance.

SUMMARY

At the meeting on October 8, 2019 the City Council introduced for first reading recommending
adoption of Ordinance 1416 adopting the California Building Standards Code (Title 24,
California Code of Regulations), which serves as the basis for the design and construction of
buildings in California. All parts of the Code are updated every three years with the goal of
improved safety, sustainability, maintaining consistency, new technology and construction
methods, and reliability.

On January 1, 2020, the updated California Building Code will be become effective statewide.
Subsequently, the City of Sierra Madre is required to adopt and enforce the same code with local
amendments. Currently, the City is enforcing the 2017 California Buildings Laws with local
amendments.

The City Council did not make any modifications to Ordinance 1416, which has been written to
amend the Sierra Madre Municipal Code relating to the adoption and amendment of the 2019
California Building Laws to meet State requirements.



Page 2 of 4

After discussion of the proposed amendments, the City Council in a noticed public hearing
approved for first reading, Ordinance 1416.

Staff recommends that the City Council introduce and approve for second reading by title only,
and waive further reading, recommending adoption of Ordinance 1416 pursuant to the 2019

California Building Standards Code amendment, and direct the City Attorney to prepare a
summary of Ordinance 1416 pursuant to Government Code Section 36933(c)(1).

ANALYSIS

Ordinance 1416 amends Title(s): 15.04, 15.06, 15.08, 15.16, 15.20, 15.26, 15.30, 15.34 and
15.36 as follows:

Section 1 Adoption of the California Building Code with specific amendments.

Section 15.04.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Building Code with specific
amendments applicable to the City of Sierra Madre as the amendments developed by the Los
Angeles County Regional Uniform Code Program.

Section 2 Adoption of the California Residential Code with specific amendments.

Section 15.06.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Residential Code with specific
amendments applicable to the City of Sierra Madre as the amendments developed by the Los
Angeles County Regional Uniform Code Program.

Section 3 Adoption of the California Mechanical Code with specific amendments.

Section 15.08.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Mechanical Code with specific
amendments applicable to the City of Sierra Madre.

Section 4 Adoption of the California Electrical Code with specific amendments.

Section 15.16.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Electrical Code with specific
amendments applicable to the City of Sierra Madre.

Section 5 Adoption of the California Plumbing Code with specific amendments.

Section 15.20.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Plumbing Code with specific
amendments applicable to the City of Sierra Madre.

Section 6 Adoption of the Existing Building Code.
Section 15.26.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 International Existing Building.

Section 7 Adoption of the California Green Building Code



Page 3 of 4

Section 15.030.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Green Building Code with specific
amendments applicable to the City of Sierra Madre as the amendments developed by the Los
Angeles County Regional Uniform Code Program Code.

Section 8 Adoption of the California Energy Code.

Section 15.34.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Energy Code with specific
amendments applicable to the City of Sierra Madre as the amendments developed by the Los
Angeles County Regional Uniform Code Program Code.

Section 9 Adoption of the California Referenced Standards Code.

Section 15.36.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Referenced Standards Code.
Section 10  Reference to pervious code adoptions and continuing legal effect.

Section 11  Continuity of previous codes.

Section 12  Enforceability of code.

Section 13  Supplementary of existing law.

Section 14  Modifications of California Building Code.

Section 15  Severability.

Section 16  Effective Date.

Section 17  CEQA exemption.

Section 18 Publication.

Section 19 Certification.

FINANCIAL REVIEW/SOURCE OF FUNDING

There is no fiscal impact related to the adoption of Ordinance 1416. Staff time was incurred in
the preparation of the report and draft ordinance.

ENVIRONMENTAL (CEQA)

The project qualifies for an exemption from the California Environmental Quality Act review
pursuant to Title 14, Section 15061(b)(3) of the California Code of Regulations as it can be seen
with certainty that there is no possibility the adoption of the Ordinance may have a significant
effect on the environment, because it will enforce the California Building Standards Code (Title
24 California Code of Regulations) that serve as the basis for the design and construction of
buildings in California to improve safety, sustainability, maintaining consistency, new
technology and construction methods, and reliability.




Page 4 of 4

PUBLIC NOTICE PROCESS

This item has been noticed through the regular agenda notification process. This item has been noticed
though the regular agenda notification process. Notice of the hearing was published consistent
with the requirements of Government Code Section 65090, including publication of a summary
notice of public hearing in the local adjudicated newspaper. Copies of this report are available at
the City Hall public counter, at the Sierra Madre Public Library, and can be accessed on the City’s
website at www.cityofsierramadre.com.

Attachments

Attachment 1: City Council Ordinance 1416

Exhibit A - Sierra Madre 2019 California Building Code Findings


http://www.cityofsierramadre.com/

ATTACHMENT 1

ORDINANCE NO 1416

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
SIERRA MADRE AMENDING THE MUNCIPAL CODE TO ADOPT
BY REFERENCE THE 2019 CALIFORNIA BUILDING
STANDARDS CODES WITH CERTAIN  EXCEPTIONS,
MODIFICATIONS AND ADDITIONS

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Sierra Madre does hereby find
that there is a need to enforce the most current editions of the California Building
Standards Code, with the local amendments recited herein for regulating and
controlling the design, erection, construction, enlargement, installation, alteration,
repair, relocation, removal, use, occupancy, demolition, conversion, height, area,
location, maintenance, and quality of materials of all buildings and structures and
plumbing, mechanical, electrical and fire suppression systems and certain
equipment’s within the City;

WHEREAS, pursuant to sections 17922, 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of
the California Health & Safety Code, the City may adopt the provisions of the
Building, Residential, Green Building Standards, Energy, Referenced Standards
Plumbing, Mechanical and Electric Codes, with certain amendments to the
provisions of the codes which are reasonably necessary to protect the health,
wealth and safety of citizens of Sierra Madre because of local climatic, geological
and topographical conditions;

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Sierra Madre made the factual
findings outlined in Exhibit 1 attached hereto relating to the amendments to the
uniform codes recited herein in accordance with Health & Safety Code section
18941.5;

WHEREAS, the City Council also finds that areas within the City are
hazardous fire areas that have only limited fire suppression forces and facilities
available for the protection of life and property;

WHEREAS, the City Council does hereby further find that
the southern California region, which includes the City, is within a very active
seismic area and local soil conditions can be highly expansive and subject to
local topographic considerations including extensive hillside construction that is
prone to erosion;

WHEREAS, the City Council does hereby further find that in accordance
with section 15061(b)(3) of the California Code of Regulations, the adoption of
local amendments to the California Building Standards Code, and amending the
Sierra Madre Municipal Code are exempt from the provisions of the California
Environmental Quality Act.



THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SIERRA MADRE DOES ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Amendments to Chapter 15.04, entitled “Building Code and
Permits.”

The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or added to
provide as follows:

15.04.010 Adoption of the 2019 California Building Code.

Subject to the additions, deletions and amendments specified in this chapter, the
rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain code entitled
2019 California Building Code based on the “International Building Code 2018
edition,” promulgated by the International Code Council and referred to and by
this reference expressly incorporated herein and made part hereof as fully and
for all intents and purposes as though set forth at length, and said 2019
California Building Code is made part of this code and the same shall be
designated, known and referred to as the “building code” of and for the city.

15.04.030 Amendment to Section 702 Very High Fire Hazard Severity
Zone.

A. The definition of “Very high fire hazard severity zone” in Section 702A of the
2019 California Building Code is amended to provide as follows.

Fire hazard severity zones are geographical areas designated pursuant to
California Public Resources Code sections 4201 through 4204 and classified as
very high, high, or moderate in state responsibility areas or as local agency very
high fire hazard severity zones designated pursuant to California Government
Code sections 51175 through 51189. See California Fire Code Atrticle 86.

The California Code of Regulations Title 14 Sections 1280 entitles the maps of
these geographical areas as “maps of the fire hazard severity zones in the state
responsibility area of California.”

For the purposes of this code, the entire city of Sierra Madre is hereby
established as a Fire District and shall contain within it an area designated as a
very high fire hazard severity zone, and shall include such territories or portions
of said city as outlined in Chapter 15.04 of the Sierra Madre Municipal Code.
Whenever in this code, reference is made to any fire zone; it shall be construed
to mean the fire zone created by this chapter.

B. Section 704A 2019 California Building Code is revised to add:



Building or structures hereafter erected, constructed, moved within or into the
very high fire hazard severity zone shall meet the requirements of this section as
follows:

1. Exterior walls of all buildings shall be of one-hour, fire-resistive
construction. Exterior glass in such walls shall be double-glazed. Wood
shake shingles being used as an exterior wall covering shall be treated
with an approved fire retardant chemical.

2. Roof soffits (including eaves), open patios, carports, porches, unenclosed
underfloor areas and all open structures, attached or detached, shall be
protected on the under side with materials as approved for one-hour fire-
resistive construction or shall be of incombustible materials throughout.

Exceptions:

a. Asphalt composition shingles with Class "B" rating.

b. When in the opinion of the Building Official, no material increase in fire
hazard will occur, additions not exceeding twenty-five percent (25%) of
the existing square footage over the life of the building, may be
covered with the same materials used on the existing building.

c. Any roof covering conforming to the specifications of the Underwriters
Laboratory (UL) for Class "A" roof covering as published in the
Underwriters Laboratory "List of Fire Protection Equipment and
Materials" shall be considered a "fire-retardant” roof covering".

15.04.090 Amendment to Section 1505 Roofs — Fire Classifications.

The 2019 California Building Code Section is amended to add the following to
Sections 1505:

A. Any building alteration, replacement or repair, which does not exceed twenty-
five percent of the area of the existing roof, over the life of the structure, may use
existing like materials on said roof.

B. Any building alteration, replacement or repair, which exceeds fifty percent of
the area of the existing roof, over the life of the structure, shall be made with fire
retardant covering as specified in the California Building Code.

C. Any building alteration, replacement or repair, which exceeds fifty percent of
the area of the existing roof, over the life of the structure, shall be made with fire
retardant covering as specified in the 2019 California Building Code.

D. Any building addition, which does not exceed twenty-five percent of the area
of the existing roof, over the life of the structure, may use existing like material on
the roof addition, and any alteration, replacement or repairs to the existing roof,
required by such addition may also use existing like materials.



E. Any building addition, which exceeds twenty-five percent of the area of the
existing roof, over the life of the structure, shall be made with fire retardant
covering as specified in the 2019 California Building Code, and any alterations,
replacements or repairs to the existing roof, required by such addition, shall also
be made with such fire retardant roof covering.

F. Wood roofs shall not be considered a Class A covering regardless of the
rating of an assembly.

15.04.100 Amendment — Section 202 — Additions, alterations or repairs.

A. The following is added to the end of Section 202 of the 2019 California
Building Code:

The phrase “additions, alterations and repairs” as used in this section, and all
subsections thereof, shall not be construed to apply to the remodeling of an
existing building to provide new facades or other aesthetic embellishments or
accouterments which do not modify the structural support or members of such
building.

B. Section 3403 of the 2019 California Building Code is amended to include and
read as follows:

Section 3403 Buildings or structures to which additions, alterations or repairs are
made shall comply with all requirements of this code for new facilities except as
specifically provided in this section. See section 907 of the Building Code for
provisions requiring installation of smoke detectors in existing Group R, Division
3 Occupancies.

15.04.110 Amendment — Section 109.4 Work commencing before permit
Issuance.

The following is added to the end of Section 109.4 of the 2019 California Building
Code:

Where the work for which permit is required by this code is started or proceeded
prior to obtaining said permit, the building permit fee shall be doubled, but the
payment of such double fee shall not relieve any persons from fully complying
with the requirements of this Code in the execution of the work nor from any
penalties prescribed herein.

15.04.115 - Section 105.7 Demolition Permits.

The following is added to Section 105 of the 2019 California Building Code.



Section 105.7 Demolition Permits.

A.

No permit for the demolition of all or any substantial portion of any building in
the city shall be issued for a period of thirty days after such application is
made. For the purposes of this chapter, demolition shall be considered the
alteration, reconstruction, or elimination of 50% or more, of the floor area or
monetary value. Projects that involve less than 50% of the alteration,
reconstruction, or elimination of the floor area or monetary value may still be
subject to requirements of Chapter 8.13 and/or 12.20 of this code.

There is a 30 day wait period after the application is submitted.

. Within 10 days of the application, the applicant should submit a mitigation

plan for vermin, noise, dust, asbestos, salvage, trash removal, air pollution,
historic preservation, and neighborhood peace and enjoyment. Failure to
submit such mitigation report may be grounds for denying such permit.

. Notice of the application for a demolition permit shall be made available within

three days to every city councilmember and city official. Copies of the
applicant's mitigation report shall also be made in similar fashion.

Prior to the release of the demolition permit, the applicant shall demonstrate
that notification of, and compliance with, the following:

1. South Coast Air Quality Management District (AQMD);
2. Electricity provider;
3. Natural gas provider; and

4. City Department of Public Works (Chapters 8.13 and 12.20.)

Prior to the issuance of a demolition permit, the applicant shall file (in general
terms) his/her intended reuse of the property with development services
department. Such plan shall indicate the intended use and condition of the
property after the demolition of structures requested within the demolition
permit is concluded.

. Notwithstanding any other provision of this chapter, in the event of an

immediate threat to the public health, safety and welfare, the thirty-day "wait"
period for the issuance of a demolition permit may be waived. Evidence of
such an immediate threat shall be submitted by the applicant to the director of
development services. Upon receipt of such information, the director of
development services shall determine if an immediate threat to the public



health, safety and welfare exists.

H. The filing of any notice or report, as called for herein, is not intended to vest
any discretion (under CEQA or otherwise) in the building official to deny such
application. Instead, at the end of the thirty-day period, such permit shall be
issued unless such issuance is contrary to any law or regulation applicable at
that date.

I. To the extent, if any, that this Section 115 differs from the 2019 California
Building Code (CBC), the city council finds that there are conditions unique to
this city that justify such change, including high fire danger, steep hillsides,
vermin infestation, wildlife and asbestos levels, the issuance of a demolition
permit shall be considered a ministerial duty under the provisions of CEQA
Section 15268 except for historical and unique archeological resources as
outlined in CEQA Section 15064.5. If the demolition permit is for a historic
structure, a cultural resources report shall be prepared at the property owner's
expense.

J. Any person, firm or corporation demolishing a structure without a permit shall
be guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction of any such person shall be
punishable by a fine of not more than one thousand dollars or by
imprisonment in the city jail for not more than one hundred eighty days, or by
both such fine and imprisonment.

K. Demolitions of Historic Structure.

1. If a structure that is deemed to be a historic resource is demolished
without a permit:

a) The violator shall within one year completely rebuild the demolished
structure to pre-existing condition and shall submit a surety bond that
shall be in amount equal to the replacement value as calculated by the
department of development services;

b) The city may rebuild it within said one-year period placing the costs
thereof as a lien on the property which shall indemnify the city against
all costs so incurred and all liabilities arising there from; or

c) No building or construction related permits shall be issued, and no
permits or use of the property shall be allowed, from the date of
demolition for a specified time period, as follows: for five years, if the
structure was listed or deemed eligible for listing on the local, state, or
Federal Registry of Historic Resources. In addition, for a historic
structure, a cultural resources report shall be prepared at the property
owner's expense. For the purposes of this section, the demolition shall
be presumed to have occurred on the date the city has actual
knowledge of the demolition. The owner shall have the burden of



proving a different date if one is claimed. Such waiting period shall be
for the purpose of consideration of rebuilding, relocation, grants, etc.,
for replacement.

2. The Director Planning and Community Preservation services shall cause
notice that this section is applicable to property to be served by mail on
the person shown as the owner on the rolls of the tax assessor, and on
any other person known to have an interest in the property, as soon as
practicable after having knowledge that the provisions of this section are
applicable to property. The date the city first had actual knowledge of the
demolition shall be stated in the notice. The provisions of this subsection
are directory only.

3. The decision of the Director that this section is applicable may be
appealed by the property owner to the city council. The city council may
grant relief from the requirements of this section if the demolition in
violation of this section was not done to any of the following:

a) A building or structure deemed eligible for landmark status;

b) A building or structure listed or deemed eligible for listing in the
National Register of Historic Places;

c) A building or structure listed or deemed eligible for listing in the
California Register of Historical Resources;

d) Any cultural resource determined to have historic significance.
15.04.117 Section 105.2 Work Exempt from Permits.

Section 105.2 Building Exception 2 is hereby deleted and the following is added
at the end of Section 105.2 of the 2019 California Building Code:

“All walls, retaining walls and fences regardless of type or height shall require
building permits.”

15.04.118 Amendment — Section 903 Automatic Fire Sprinklers.

The following sections within section 903 of the 2019 California Building Code,
entitled, “Automatic Sprinkler Systems” are revised to provide as follows:

903.2.1.1 Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
1 occupancies in accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal Code section
15.24.120.

903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
A-2 occupancies in accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal Code section
15.24.120.



903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
A-3 occupancies in accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal Code section
15.24.120.

903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
A-4 occupancies in accordance with Code Sierra Madre Municipal section
15.24.120.

903.2.1.5 Group A-5. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
A-5 occupancies in the following areas: concession stands, retail areas, press
boxes, and other accessory use areas in accordance with Code section
15.24.120.

903.2.2 Group B ambulatory health care facilities. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout all buildings containing Group B ambulatory health
care occupancy in accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal Code section
15.24.120.

903.2.3 Group E. Except as provided for in Sections 903.2 .2 .1 for a new public
school campus and 907.2.3.6.1 (fire alarm and detection) for modernization of an
existing public school campus building(s), an automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided for Group E occupancies in accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
all buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy in accordance with Sierra Madre
Municipal Code section 15.24.120.

903.2.5 Group H. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided in high-hazard
occupancies as required in Sections 903.2.5.1 through 903.2.5.3.

903.2.5.1 General. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in Group H
occupancies in accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

903.2.6 Group I. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings with a Group | in accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal Code section
15.24.120.

903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings containing a Group M occupancy in accordance with Sierra Madre
Municipal Code section 15.24.120.

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R in
accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal Code section 15.24.110.



903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
all buildings containing a Group S-1 in accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings used as repair garages in accordance with the California
Building Code.

903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires. Buildings and structures with an area for the
storage of shall be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as enclosed parking garages in accordance with Section
409.4 of the California Building Code or where physically located beneath other
occupancy groups.

903.2.10.1 Commercial parking garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial trucks or buses.

15.04.120 Adoption of Los Angeles Regional Code Program — Los Angeles
Basin Chapter 2019 Technical Amendments.

The 2019 California Building, Code is hereby amended by adopting by reference
the Technical Amendments as published on

May 29, 2019 by the Los Angeles Regional Uniform Regional Code Program —
International Code Council — Los Angeles Basin Chapter.

SECTION 2. Amendments to Chapter 15.06, entitled “California
Residential Code.”

The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or added to

provide as follows:

15.06.010 Adoption of the 2019 California Residential Code.

Subject to the additions, deletions and amendments specified in this chapter, the
rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain code entitled
2019 California Residential Code based on the “International Residential Code
2018 edition,” promulgated by the International Code Council of Whittier,
California. and referred to and by this reference expressly incorporated herein
and made part hereof as fully and for all intents and purposes as though set forth
at length, and said 2019 California Residential Code is made part of this code
and the same shall be designated, known and referred to as the “Residential
Code” of and for the city.

15.06.020 Amendment - Section R105.2 Work Exempt from Permits.

Section R102.2 Building Exception 2 is hereby deleted and the following is added
to the end of Section R105.2 of the 2019 California Residential Code:



“All walls, retaining walls and fences regardless of type or height shall require
building permits.”

15.06.030 Amendment - Section R108.6 Work commencing before permit
issuance.

The following is added to the end of Section R108.6 of the 2019 California
Residential Code:

Where the work for which permit is required by this code is started or proceeded
prior to obtaining said permit, the building permit fee shall be doubled, but the
payment of such double fee shall not relieve any persons from fully complying
with the requirements of this Code in the execution of the work nor from any
penalties prescribed herein.

15.06.040 Amendment - Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems.

Section R313.1 of the California 2019 Residential Code is amended to provide as
follows:

“An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in townhouses in
accordance with accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal code section
15.24.110.”

15.06.050 Amendment - One and two family dwellings automatic fire
systems.

The following is added to the end of Section R313.2 of the 2019 California
Residential Code:

“An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in one- and two-
family dwellings in accordance with accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal
code section 15.24.110.”

15.06.060 Amendment — Required sprinkler locations, exception 4.

Section R313.3.1.1, of the California 2019 Residential Code exception 4 is
amended to read as follows:

“Detached garages and carports in accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal code
section 15.24.110.”



15.06.070 Water flow detector alarm.

A new section R313.3.3.5 of the California 2019 Residential Code is added to the
Residential code and shall be entitled “Water flow detector alarm.” That section
shall provide:

“‘Water supply.”

“The flow of one sprinkler shall activate a water flow detector alarm that shall be
audible on the exterior of the building.”

15.06.080 Adoption of Los Angeles Regional Uniform Code Program
Technical amendments to the 2019 California Residential Code.

The 2019 California Residential Code is hereby amended by adopting by
reference the Technical Amendments as published by the Los Angeles Regional
Uniform Regional Code Program — International Code Council — Los Angeles
Basin Chapter published May 29, 2019.

SECTION 3. Amendments to Chapter 15.08, entitled “California
Mechanical Code.”

The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or added to
provide as follows:

The following sections of the 2019 California Mechanical Code are amended or
added to provide as follows:

15.08.010 Adoption of the California Mechanical Code.

The 2019 California Mechanical Code which is based on the Uniform Mechanical
Code, 2018 Edition,” published by the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials is adopted by reference, together with all indexes and
appendixes therefore, except as herein amended in this chapter and said 2013
California Mechanical Code is made part of this code and this chapter shall be
designated, as known and referred to as the “mechanical code” of and for the
city.

15.08.030 Amendment — Section 110.0 Violation.

Section 110.0 of the 2019 California Mechanical code is amended to include the
phrase:

‘In addition to the penalties herein above provided, any condition caused or
permitted to exist in violation of any of the provisions of this code shall be
deemed a public nuisance and may be abated in the manner provided by law as



such. Every day such condition continues shall be regarded as a new separate
offense.”

SECTION 4. Amendments to Chapter 15.16, “California Electrical Code.”

A. The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or
added to provide as follows:

15.16.010 Adoption of the 2019 California Electrical Code.

Subject to the additions, deletions, and amendments specified in this chapter, the
rules regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in those certain codes
entitled, 2019 California Electrical Code which is based “National Electrical Code,
2017 Edition,” therein contained, published by the National; Fire Protection
Association is adopted by reference, together with all indexes and appendixes
therefore, except as herein amended in this chapter and said 2019 California
Electrical Code is made part of this code and this chapter shall be designated, as
known and referred to as the “electrical code” of and for the city.

B. Section 15.16.015 is added to the municipal code to provide as follows:

15.16.015 Amendment - Annex H: Administration Section 80.27
Inspectors Qualifications.

Section 80.27 of the 2019 California Electrical Code is amended to provide the
phrase “The Building Official is exempt from requiring certification as an electrical
inspector.”

SECTION 5. Amendments to Chapter 15.20, entitled “California Plumbing
Code.”

The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or added to
provide as follows:

Chapter 15.20.10 Adoption of the 2019 California Plumbing Code and
Appendixes.

The 2019 California Plumbing Code which is based on The Uniform International
Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition, is adopted. That certain document “International
Plumbing Code, 2018 Edition,” published by International Association of
Plumbing and Mechanical Officials is adopted by reference, together with all
indexes and appendixes thereof and therefore, except as herein amended in this
chapter and said 2019 California Plumbing code is made part of this code and
this chapter shall be referred to as the “plumbing code” of and for the city.



15.20.060 Section 710.1 Drainage of fixtures located below the next
upstream manhole or below the main sewer level.

Section 710.1 of the 2019 California Plumbing Code shall be amended to read as
follows:

Sewage backflow. Where the flood level rims of plumbing fixtures are below the
elevation of the manhole cover of the next upstream manhole in the public sewer,
such fixtures shall be protected by a backwater valve installed in the building
drain, branch of the building drain or horizontal branch serving such fixtures.
Plumbing fixtures having flood rim levels above the elevation of the manhole
cover of the next upstream manhole in the public sewer shall not discharge
through a backwater valve.

SECTION 6. Amendments to Chapter 15.26, entitled “Existing Building
Code.”

The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or added to
provide as follows:

15.26.010 Adoption of the 2018 Existing Building Code.

Subject to any additions, deletions and amendments that may exist in this
chapter, the rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain
code entitled "Existing Building Code 2018 Edition,” promulgated by the
International Code Conference and referred to and by this reference expressly
incorporated herein and made a part thereof as fully and for all intents and
purposes as though set forth at length, and said Existing | Building Code is made
a part of this code and the same shall be designated, known and referred to as
the "existing building code" of and for the city.

SECTION 7. Amendments to Chapter 15.30, entitled “Green Building
Standards Code.”

The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or added to
provide as follows:

Section 15.30.010 — Adoption of 2019 California Green Building Standards
Code.

Subject to any additions, deletions and amendments that may exist in this
chapter, the rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain
code entitled "California Green Building Standards Code 2019 Edition,” and
referred to and by this reference expressly incorporated herein and made a part
thereof as fully and for all intents and purposes as though set forth at length, and
said California Green Building Standards Code is made a part of this code and



the same shall be designated, known and referred to as the "green building
code" of and for the city.

15.30.030 Adoption of Los Angeles Regional Uniform Code Program
Technical Amendments to the 2019 California Green Building Standards
Code.

The 2019 California Green Buildings Standards Code is hereby amended by
adopting all of the Technical Amendments as published by the Los Angeles
Regional Uniform Regional Code Program — International Code Council — Los
Angeles Basin Chapter published on May 29, 2019.

SECTION 8. Amendments to Chapter 15.34, entitled “CALIFORNIA
ENERGY CODE.”

The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or added to
provide as follows:

15.34.010 — Adoption of 2019 California Energy Code.

Subject to any additions, deletions and amendments that may exist in this
chapter, the rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain
code entitled "California Energy Code 2019 Edition,” and referred to and by this
reference expressly incorporated herein and made a part thereof as fully and for
all intents and purposes as though set forth at length, and said California Energy
Code is made a part of this code and the same shall be designated, known and
referred to as the "energy code" of and for the city.

SECTION 9. Amendments to Chapter 15.36, entitled “REFERENCED
STANDARDS CODE.”

The following sections of the Municipal Code are hereby amended or added to
provide as follows:

15.36.010 Adoption of the 2019 California Referenced Standards Code.

Subject to any additions, deletions and amendments that may exist in this
chapter, the rules, regulations, provisions and conditions set forth in that certain
code entitled "California Referenced Standards Code 2019 Edition,” promulgated
by the International Code Conference and referred to and by this reference
expressly incorporated herein and made a part thereof as fully and for all intents
and purposes as though set forth at length, and said California Referenced
Standards Code is made a part of this code and the same shall be designated,
known and referred to as the "referenced standards" of and for the city.



SECTION 10. References in Documents and Continuing Legal Effect.
References to prior versions of any portion of the Building Standards Code, or of
the Sierra Madre Municipal Code that are amended or renumbered in this
Municipal Code, that are cited on notices issued by the City or other documents
of ongoing or continuing legal effect, including resolutions adopting or imposing
fees or charges, until converted, are deemed to be references to the new
counterpart part of the Building Standards Code or amended Municipal Code
sections for the purposes of notice and enforcement. The provisions adopted
hereby shall not in any manner affect deposits, established fees or other matters
of record which refer to, or are otherwise connected with, ordinances which are
specifically designated by number, code section or otherwise, but such
references shall be deemed to apply to the corresponding provisions set forth in
the code sections adopted or amended hereby.

SECTION 11. Continuity. To the extent the provisions of this Ordinance
are substantially the same as previous provisions of the Sierra Madre Municipal
Code, these provisions shall be construed as continuations of those provisions
and not as amendments of the earlier provisions.

SECTION 12. No Effect on Enforceability. The repeal of any sections of
the Municipal Code, shall not affect or impair any act done, or right vested or
approved, or any proceeding, suit or prosecution had or commenced in any
cause before such repeal shall take effect; but every such act, vested right,
proceeding, suit, or prosecution shall remain in full force and effect for all
purposes as if the applicable provisions of the Municipal Code, or part thereof,
had remained in force and effect. No offense committed and no liability, penalty,
or forfeiture, either civil or criminal, incurred prior to the repeal or alteration of any
applicable provision of the 2019 Code as amended, shall be discharged or
affected by such repeal or alteration but prosecutions and suits for such offenses,
liabilities, penalties or forfeitures shall be instituted and proceed in all respects as
if the applicable provisions of the 2019 Code, as amended, had not been
repealed or altered.

SECTION 13. Supplementary of Existing Law. The City Council intends
this Ordinance to supplement, not to duplicate or contradict, applicable state and
federal law and this Ordinance shall be construed in light of that intent.

SECTION 14. Modifications to California Building Standards Code. Al
inconsistencies between the Building Standards Code as amended and adopted
by this ordinance, and Parts 2, 2.5, 3, 4, 5, 6, 8, and 10 of Title 24 the California
Code of Regulations are changes, modifications, amendments, additions or
deletions thereto authorized by California Health and Safety Code Sections
17858 and 17858.7.

SECTION 15. Severability. Should any section, subsection, clause, or
provision of this Ordinance for any reason be held to be invalid or




unconstitutional, such invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity
or constitutionality of the remaining portions of this Ordinance; it being hereby
expressly declared that this Ordinance, and each section, subsection, sentence,
clause, and phrase hereof would have been prepared, proposed, approved, and
ratified irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections,
sentences, clauses, or phrases be declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 16. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be effective January 1,
2020.
SECTION 17. CEQA. The project qualifies for an exemption from the

California Environmental Quality Act review pursuant to Title 14, Section
15061(b)(3) of the California Code of Regulations as it can be seen with certainty
that there is no possibility the adoption of the Ordinance may have a significant
effect on the environment, because it will enforce the California Building
Standards Code (Title 24 California Code of Regulations) that serve as the basis
for the design and construction of buildings in California to improve safety,
sustainability, maintaining consistency, new technology and construction
methods, and reliability.

SECTION 18. Publication. The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this
ordinance and shall cause the same to be processed in the manner required by
law.

SECTION 19. Certification. The City Clerk shall file a certified copy of this
Ordinance with the California Building Standards Commission.

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this day of , 2019
by the following roll call vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSTAIN:
ABSENT:

Mayor

ATTEST:

Sue Spears, City Clerk



STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES ) SS:
CITY OF SIERRA MADRE )

l, , City Clerk of the City of Sierra
Madre, hereby certify that the foregoing Ordlnance was introduced at a regular
meeting of the City Council of the City of Sierra Madre held on the day of
October 2019, and was approved and adopted by said Council at its regular
meeting held onthe ___ day of 2019.




EXHIBIT A

SIERRA MADRE BUILDING DEPARTMENT

2019 BUILDING CODE FINDINGS

This report contains the “Findings” to support this ordinance to amend the
California Building Standards Code. Each of the proposed amendments to the
non-administrative provisions of the building standards code are based on local
climatic, geologic and topographical conditions and cause the new code to be
more restrictive in nature than the underlying California Building Standards Code.

The amendments address the building problem(s), concern(s), and future
direction(s), by which the City can establish and maintain an environment which
will afford an adequate level of building and life safety protection to its citizens
and guests.

Section 1 of this Exhibit sets forth the various finding.

Section 2 of this Exhibit explains which findings apply to which amendments.

Section 1. General Findings

The following findings apply in the City of Sierra Madre, and explain why the
changes to the Building Standards Code are necessary because of climatic,
geological and/or topographical condition is in the city.

A. Climatic Conditions

1. Normal rainfall averages 15 inches annually. During the summer and
fall months, temperatures average approximately 85 degrees and can
exceed 100 degrees for a period of days. Dry winds remove the
moisture from vegetation. During late summer and fall, winds can
move a fire quickly across the foothills or through residential areas of
Sierra Madre. Winter rains often cause floods and the threat of
damage due to water runoff.

B. Geologic Conditions

1. The beautiful mountains that border the north of Sierra Madre create a
uniqgue hazard. The foothills have become prime sites for residential
development because of their scenic beauty. The steep, narrow
canyons create narrow winding roads that lengthen response time of
emergency vehicles due to the increase in grade. Also, due to the hills
and mountainous terrain, it is difficult to ensure proper fence and wall
heights and footing depths without requiring inspections and permits.

Sierra Madre 2019 California Building Code Findings Page 1



2. The city is a densely populated area having buildings and structures

over and near major fault systems capable of producing major
earthquakes. Thus there are proposed modifications to emphasize
designs with seismic-force-resisting elements.

C. Topographic Conditions

1. The topographic element of this report is associated closely with the

geologic element noted above. While the geologic features create the
topographic conditions, the areas of findings in this Section are, for the
most part, a result of the construction and design of Sierra Madre.

. Sierra Madre has areas that are in high fire hazard zones. As stated

above, due to topography, access to structures in these fire hazard
zones increases response time and delays fire suppression efforts.
Extended response times allow fires to grow beyond the control of
initial attack resources. Additionally, large structure fires in the hillside
areas have a greater likelihood of starting wild land fires, which
exposes additional structures to fire.

. Clarification of the design parameters for projects subject to the

Building Code is necessary to assure that appropriate development is
constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives of the
International Building Code, as applied in the city of Sierra Madre.

D. Administrative

1. These amendments are necessary for administrative clarification and

do not modify any building standards. They establish standards to
effectively enforce building standards and therefore need to be
incorporated into the code to assure that new building and structures
and additions or alteration to existing buildings or structures are
designed and constructed in accordance with the scope and objectives
of the California Building Standards Code.

Section 2 — Which Findings Apply to Which Amendments

The following amendments to the 2019 Edition of the California Building
Standards Code are found reasonably necessary based on the climatic, geologic
and/or topographic conditions cited in Section 1 of this Exhibit:

California Building Code Sections Applicable Findings
Chapter 7 A-1, B-1, C-2

202, 3403 C-3

109.4 D-1

105.2 B-1, D-1

Sierra Madre 2019 California Building Code Findings Page 2



Section 903 (903.2.1.1; 903.2.1.2; 903.2.1.3;
903.2.1.4; 903.2.1.5; 903.2.2; 903.2.3;
903.2.4; 903.2.5; 903.2.5.1; 903.2.6;
903.2.7; 903.2.8; 903.2.9; 903.2.9.1;
903.2.9.2; 903.2.10; 9; 903.2.10.1)

Section 1505 (1505.1; 1505.1.1; 1505.1.2; 1505.1.3,;

1505.1.4; 1505.2)
Technical Amendments

2013 California Residential Code
R105.2

R108.6

R313.1

R313.2

R313.3.1.1 exception 4

R313.3.3.5

Technical Amendments

2013 California Mechanical Code
110.0

2013 California Electrical Code
Annex H

2013 California Plumbing Code
710.1

2012 Existing Building Code
SMMC 15.26.020

2013 California Green Building Code
SMMC 15.30.020
Technical Amendments

2013 California Energy Code
SMMC 15.34.020

2013 California Referenced Standards Code
SMMC 15.36.020

Sierra Madre 2019 California Building Code Findings

A-1, B-1, C-2

A-1; B-1; C-1; C-2
A-1, B-1, B-2, C-1, C-2, D-1

Applicable Findings

B-1, D-1

D-1

A-1, B-1, C-2

A-1, B-1, C-2

A-1, B-1, C-2

A-1, B-1, C-2

A-1, B-1, B-2, C-1, C-2, D-1

Applicable Findings
D-1

Applicable Findings
D-1

Applicable Findings
B-1, C-1,D-1

Applicable Findings
D-1

Applicable Findings
D-1
A-1, B-1, B-2, C-1, C-2, D-1

Applicable Findings
D-1

Applicable Findings
D-1

Page 3



John Harabedian, Mayor

John Capoccia, Mayor Pro Tem
Rachelle Arizmendi, Council Member
Denise Delmar, Council Member
Gene Goss, Council Member

City of Sierra Madre

Sue Spears, City Clerk,

Agenda Report Michael Amerio City Treasurer
TO: Honorable Mayor Harabedian and Members of the City Council
FROM: Richard Snyder, Fire Marshal
REVIEWED BY: Gabriel Engeland, City Manager
DATE: October 22, 2019
SUBJECT: SECOND READING OF ORDINANCE 1417 — ADOPTION OF THE

2019 FIRE CODE

STAFF RECOMMENDATION

Staff recommends Alternative No. 1 that the City Council introduce and approve for second reading
Ordinance 1417 by title only, recommending adoption of Ordinance 1417 pursuant to the 2019
California Fire Code and International Fire Code amendments.

ALTERNATIVES
1. Introduce and approve for second reading by title only, and waive further reading adopting
Ordinance 1417 pursuant to the 2019 California Fire Code and International Fire Code
amendments.

2. Introduce and approve for second reading by title only, and waive further reading adopting
Ordinance 1417 pursuant to the 2019 California Fire Code as amended by the City Council.

SUMMARY

At the meeting on October 8, 2019 the City Council introduced for first reading recommending
adoption of Ordinance 1417 adopting the California Fire Code and International Fire Code
amendments, which serves as the basis for fire regulation in the State of California.

On January 1, 2020, The State of California will be adopting a new fire code. Subsequently, the City of
Sierra Madre is required to adopt and enforce the same code with local amendments. Currently, the
City is enforcing the 2016 California Fire Code with local amendments.

Ordinance No. 1417 has been written to amend Title 15.24 of the Sierra Madre Municipal Code
relating to the adoption and amendment of the 2019 California Fire Code to meet with State
requirements. Additionally, this Ordinance amends current fire sprinkler requirements.

The City Council did not make any modifications to Ordinance 1417, which has been written to amend
the Sierra Madre Municipal Code relating to the adoption and amendment of the 2019 California Fire
Code and International Fire Code to meet State requirements.

After discussion of the proposed amendments, the City Council in a noticed public hearing approved
for first reading, Ordinance 1417.



Page 2 of 3

Staff recommends Alternative No. 1 that the City Council introduce and approve for second reading
Ordinance 1417 by title only, recommending adoption of Ordinance 1417 pursuant to the 2019
California Fire Code and International Fire Code amendments.

ANALYSIS
Ordinance 1417 amends Title15.24 as follows:

Section 1. Section 15.24.010 is amended to adopt the 2019 California Fire Code.

Section 2. Section 15.24.020 is amended to replace the words “International Fire Code” with
“California Fire Code”

Section 3. Section 15.24.070 Amendments to the California Fire Code.

Section 101.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to identify “this code” as the Sierra
Madre Fire Code.

Section 110.4 identifies fire code violations and penalties as Administrative Citations as
defined in Sierra Madre Municipal Code Title 1.18 - Administrative Enforcement.

Section 112.4 identifies failure to comply penalties as Administrative Citations as defined in
Sierra Madre Municipal Code Title 1.18 - Administrative Enforcement.

Section 307.4.2 of the California Fire Code is amended to allow the Fire Code Official to
order recreational fires to be discontinued if such fires constitute a hazardous condition or if
atmospheric conditions reach critical levels.

Section 503.2.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to require new fire access roads to
have a minimum width of 26 feet within 25 feet of each side of a fire hydrant. This requirement will
prevent the problem of an access road being blocked when a fire engine is utilizing a fire hydrant.

Sections 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.1.5, 903.2.2, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,
903.2.5, 903.2.6, 903.2.7, 903.2.8, 903.2.9, 903.2.9.1, 903.2.9.2, 903.2.10 and 903.2.10.1 of the fire
code are amended in order to maintain the current fire sprinkler requirements as set forth in Section
15.24.120 of the Sierra Madre Municipal Code.

APPENDIX D-Fire Apparatus Access Roads is adopted and amended to require new fire
access roads to have a minimum width of 26 feet within 25 feet of each side of a fire hydrant. This
requirement will help prevent the problem of an access road being blocked when a fire engine is
utilizing a fire hydrant.

Section 4. Section 15.24.110 is amended to include additional design options for residential fire
sprinklers by adding “Section R313 of the California Residential Code”

Section 5. Section 15.24.120 is amended to remove the requirement for fire sprinklers in residential
attics with light weight truss construction.

Sections 6-18. Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances and other legal Code Adoption language.



Page 3 of 3

FINANCIAL REVIEW/SOURCE OF FUNDING
There is no fiscal impact related to this agenda item.

ENVIRONMENTAL (CEQA)

The project qualifies for an exemption from the California Environmental Quality Act review pursuant
to Title 14, Section 15061(b)(3) of the California Code of Regulations as it can be seen with certainty
that there is no possibility the adoption of this Ordinance may have a significant effect on the
environment, because it will enforce the 2019 California Fire Code in compliance with State
requirements.

PUBLIC NOTICE PROCESS

This item has been noticed through the regular agenda notification process. Copies of this report are
available at the City Hall public counter, at the Sierra Madre Public Library, and at the City’s website
at www.cityofsierramadre.com

Attachments
Attachment 1 - City Council Ordinance 1417 - 2019 Fire Code Adoption

Exhibit A- Sierra Madre Fire Department 2019 Fire Code Findings


http://www.cityofsierramadre.com/

ATTACHMENT 1

ORDINANCE 1417

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SIERRA MADRE
AMENDING TITLE 15.24 OF THE SIERRA MADRE
MUNICIPAL CODE RELATING TO THE ADOPTION
AND AMENDMENTS TO THE 2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE AND FIRE SPRINKLER REQUIREMENTS

The City Council of the City of Sierra Madre does hereby ordain as follows:

SECTION 1. Municipal Code Amendment. Section 15.24.010 of the Sierra Madre
Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

SECTION 15.24.010 ADOPTION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

There is hereby adopted by the City Council of the City of Sierra Madre for the
purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and
property from fire or explosion, that certain Code known as the 2019 Edition of
the California Fire Code based on the 2018 Edition of the International Fire
Code published by the International Code Council except such portions as are
hereinafter deleted, modified or amended by Section 15.24.070 of the Sierra
Madre Municipal Code and portions of the International Fire Code, From the
date on which this ordinance shall take effect, the provisions of the 2019
California Fire Code shall be controlling within the limits of the City of Sierra
Madre.

SECTION 2. Municipal Code Amendment. Section 15.24.020 of the Sierra Madre
Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

15.24.020 - Establishment and duties of the bureau of fire prevention.

The California Fire Code shall be enforced by the bureau of fire prevention in the fire
department of the city which is established and which shall be operated under the
supervision of the chief of the fire department.

SECTION 3. Municipal Code Amendment. Section 15.24.070 of the Sierra Madre
Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

SECTION 15.24.070 AMENDMENTS TO THE 2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE

A. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the
City of Sierra Madre, hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

B. Section 110.4 is amended to read as follows:



110.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this
code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who
shall erect, install alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a
permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty
of an Administrative Violation in accordance with Sierra Madre
Municipal Code Section 1.18.010.

Section 112.4 is amended to read as follows:

112.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after
having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that
person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition,
shall be liable to a fine in accordance with Sierra Madre Municipal Code
Section 1.18.070.

Section 307.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

307.4.2 Recreational fires. Recreational fires shall not be conducted
within 25 feet (760mm) of a structure or combustible material.
Conditions which could cause a fire to spread within 25 feet (7620 mm)
of a structure shall be eliminated.

Discontinuance. The fire code official or his representative is authorized
to require that recreational fires be immediately discontinued if such
fires are determined by the chief to constitute a hazardous condition or
if atmospheric conditions reach critical levels as specified in the policies
and procedures of the fire prevention bureau.

Section 503.2.1 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical conditions as identified in the 2019 Fire Code
Findings of Fact as filed with the California Building Standards
Commission:

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an
unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), except for
approved security gates in accordance with section 503.6, and an
unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches
(4115mm).

1. When fire hydrants are required, fire apparatus access roads shall
have an unobstructed width of not less than 26 feet (4114 mm) within a
linear distance of 25 feet (7620 mm) each side of the hydrant.

Section 903.2.1.1 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in



the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.1.1 Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
for Group A-1 occupancies in accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.1.2 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
for Group A-2 occupancies in accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.1.3 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
for Group A-3 occupancies in accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.1.4 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
for Group A-4 occupancies in accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.1.5 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.1.5 Group A-5. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
for Group A-5 occupancies in the following areas: concession stands,
retail areas, press boxes, and other accessory use areas in accordance
with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.2 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:



903.2.2 Group B Ambulatory health care facilities. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings containing
ambulatory health care facilities in accordance with Code section
15.24.120.

Section 903.2.3 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings containing a Group E occupancy in accordance
with Code section 15.24.120. (exception: For public school state-
funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19)

Section 903.2.4 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy in
accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.5 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.5 Group H. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided in
high-hazard occupancies as required in Sections 903.2.5.1 through
903.2.5.3.

903.2.5.1 General, An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in
Group H occupancies. in accordance with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.6 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.6 Group I. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings with a Group | in accordance with Code section
15.24.120.



Section 903.2.7 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings containing a Group M occupancy in accordance
with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.8 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all
buildings with a Group R fire area and in accordance with Code section
15.24.110.

Section 903.2.9 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings containing a Group S-1 in accordance with
Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.9.1 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout all buildings used as repair garages in accordance
with Code section 15.24.120.

Section 903.2.9.2 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:



903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires. Buildings and structures with an area
for the storage of shall be equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

U. Section 903.2.10 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings classified as enclosed parking garages in
accordance with Section 406.4 of the California Building Code or where
located beneath other groups.

V. Section 903.2.10.1 is amended to read as follows due to local
topographical, geological and climatic conditions as identified in
the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with the California
Building Standards Commission:

903.2.10.1 Commercial parking garages. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial
trucks or buses in accordance with Code section 15.24.120

W.  APPENDIX D-Fire Apparatus Access Roads is adopted and
amended to read as follows due to local topographical conditions
as identified in the 2019 Fire Code Findings of Fact as filed with
the California Building Standards Commission:

D103.1 Access road width with a fire hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is
located on a fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall
be 26 feet (7925 mm), within a linear distance of 25 feet (7620 mm)
each side of the hydrant, exclusive of shoulders.

SECTION 4. Municipal Code Amendment. Section 15.24.110 of the Sierra Madre
Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

15.24.110 - Automatic life safety support sprinkler system.

An approved automatic life safety support sprinkler system shall be installed in all
occupancies and locations as set forth in this section and shall meet all designated
National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) code requirements, or Section R313 of
the California Residential Code as Adopted by the State of California and the policies
and procedures of the Sierra Madre Fire Prevention Bureau as currently specified
and amended by the Sierra Madre Municipal Code:

SECTION 5. Municipal Code Amendment. Section 15.24.120 of the Sierra Madre
Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:




15.24.120 - Automatic fire extinguishing systems.
An automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be installed in the following occupancies:
A. In all new buildings within the City of Sierra Madre except group U.

B. All new Group U as classified in the International Fire Code, which are located
within thirty five (35) feet of any exposure.

C. All buildings classified as a Group A, B, E, F, H, I, M, S, U when renovated over
seventy five percent (75%) of their existing square footage.

D. All buildings classified as a Group A, B, E, F, H, I, M, S, U were an addition of fifty
percent of their existing square footage is being accomplished.

E. All Group R occupancies shall install an automatic life safety fire sprinkler system
in accordance with Code Section 15.24.110.

SECTION 6. Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances. All existing ordinances or parts
thereof conflicting or inconsistent with the provisions of this ordinance or the
California Fire Code adopted are hereby repealed.

SECTION 7. References in Documents and Continuing Legal Effect. References to
prior versions of the California Fire Code, or of the Sierra Madre Municipal Code that
are amended or renumbered in this Municipal Code, that are cited on notices issued
by the City or other documents of ongoing or continuing legal effect, including
resolutions adopting or imposing fees or charges, until converted, are deemed to be
references to the new counterpart 2019 Fire Code or amended Municipal Code
sections for the purposes of notice and enforcement. The provisions adopted hereby
shall not in any manner affect deposits, established fees or other matters of record
which refer to, or are otherwise connected with, ordinances which are specifically
designated by number, code section or otherwise, but such references shall be
deemed to apply to the corresponding provisions set forth in the code sections
adopted or amended hereby.

SECTION 8. Continuity. To the extent the provisions of this Ordinance are
substantially the same as previous provisions of the Sierra Madre Municipal Code,
these provisions shall be construed as continuations of those provisions and not as
amendments of the earlier provisions.

SECTION 9. No Effect on Enforceability. The repeal of any sections of the Municipal
Code, shall not affect or impair any act done, or right vested or approved, or any
proceeding, suit or prosecution had or commenced in any cause before such repeal
shall take effect; but every such act, vested right, proceeding, suit, or prosecution
shall remain in full force and effect for all purposes as if the applicable provisions of
the Municipal Code, or part thereof, had remained in force and effect. No offense
committed and no liability, penalty, or forfeiture, either civil or criminal, incurred prior
to the repeal or alteration of any applicable provision of the 2016 Code as amended,
shall be discharged or affected by such repeal or alteration but prosecutions and
suits for such offenses, liabilities, penalties or forfeitures shall be instituted and




proceed in all respects as if the applicable provisions of the 2016 Code, as
amended, had not been repealed or altered.

SECTION 10. Supplementary of Existing Law. The City Council intends this
Ordinance to supplement, not to duplicate or contradict, applicable state and federal
law and this Ordinance shall be construed in light of that intent.

SECTION 11. Modifications to California Fire Code. All inconsistencies between the
Municipal Fire Code, as adopted by this ordinance, and Part 9 of Title 24 the
California Code of Regulations are changes, modifications, amendments, additions
or deletions thereto authorized by California Health and Safety Code Sections 17858
and 17858.7.

SECTION 12. Findings. The City Council hereby adopts the findings attached hereto
as Exhibit A by this reference fully incorporated herein. These modifications to the
2019 California Fire Code, incorporating the 2018 International Fire Codes are
reasonably necessary due to the local climatic, geological, and topographical
reasons set forth in Exhibit A.

SECTION 13. Severability. Should any section, subsection, clause, or provision of
this Ordinance for any reason be held to be invalid or unconstitutional, such invalidity
or unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of the remaining
portions of this Ordinance; it being hereby expressly declared that this Ordinance,
and each section, subsection, sentence, clause, and phrase hereof would have been
prepared, proposed, approved, and ratified irrespective of the fact that any one or
more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses, or phrases be declared invalid or
unconstitutional.

SECTION 14. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall take effect thirty days following its
adoption as provided by Government Code Section 36937, or January 1, 2020
whichever is later.

SECTION 15. Copy with Clerk. The City Clerk shall maintain a copy of the California
Fire Code, 2019 Edition, as amended by this ordinance, for use and examination by
the public.

SECTION 16. CEQA. This Ordinance has been determined to be exempt from the
California Environmental Quality Act pursuant to State Guidelines 815061 (b) (3) as
a project that has no potential for causing a significant effect on the environment.

SECTION 17. Certification. The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this
ordinance and shall cause the same to be processed in the manner required by law.

SECTION 18. Filing with State. The City Clerk shall file a certified copy of this
Ordinance with the California Building Standards Commission.




PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED, this ___ day of , 2019

AYES:
NOES
ABSTAIN:
ABSENT:

John Harabedian, Mayor

ATTEST:

Susan Spears, City Clerk

I, Susan Spears, City Clerk of the City of Sierra Madre, California, do hereby
certify that the foregoing Ordinance was introduced at a regular meeting of the City
Council of the City of Sierra Madre held onthe _ day of 2019, and was
adopted at its regular meeting of , 2019 by the following vote:




EXHIBIT A

2019 FIRE CODE FINDINGS

Pursuant to Section 13869.7 of the California Health and Safety Code, the report
contained herein shall be the “Findings” document to support City of Sierra Madre
Ordinance No. 1417 Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been
established which are more restrictive in nature than those sections adopted by the
State of California (State Building Standards Code, and State Housing and
Community Development Code) commonly referred to as Title 24 and Title 25 of the
California Administrative Code.

The amendments to the 2019 California Fire Code have been recognized by the City
of Sierra Madre. The amendments address the fire problem(s), concern(s), and
future direction(s), by which the City can establish and maintain an environment
which will afford an adequate level of fire and life safety protection to its citizens and
guests.

Under the provisions of Section 13869.7 of the Health and Safety Code, local
amendments shall be based on climatic, geographical, or topographical conditions.
The “Findings” contained herein shall address each of these situations and shall
present the local situation, which, either singularly, or in combination, cause the
established amendments to be adopted.

SIERRA MADRE COMMUNITY PROFILE

The City of Sierra Madre was established in 1881. Sierra Madre encompasses an
area of approximately 3.2 square miles at an elevation ranging from 700 to 800 feet
above sea level. The residential population is approximately 10,800. The physical
location of Sierra Madre is bordered by the city of Pasadena to the west, Arcadia to
the south and east and the Angeles National Forest to the north.

The majority of Sierra Madre is residential housing, with a number of small
businesses and light industrial, four elementary schools, a middle school, a high
school and six churches.

Based on this profile of Sierra Madre, the Sierra Madre Fire Department established
certain requirements to increase the level of fire safety to the citizens and guests of
Sierra Madre, as well as the buildings within its boundaries. The following points
were established as factors, which caused concern to the Sierra Madre Fire
Department, and are herein established and submitted as its “Findings:”

1. CLIMATIC

Normal rainfall averages 15 inches annually. During the summer and fall
months, temperatures average approximately 85 degrees and can exceed
100 degrees for a period of days. Dry winds remove the moisture from
vegetation. During late summer and fall, winds can move a fire quickly across
the foothills or through residential areas of Sierra Madre.



Because of periods of high temperatures, accompanied by low humidity and
high winds each year. These conditions create an environment in which the
Fire Department commits the majority of its fire fighting resources to the
control and extinguishment of wildland fires. During such periods, the limited
available firefighting resources may have great difficulty in controlling fires in
structures with wood roofs and structures not having built-in fire protection.

GEOLOGICAL

Sierra Madre has within its boundaries active seismic hazards with respect to
the San Andreas and Sierra Madre faults. While systems have been
developed to study and monitor the activity of earthquakes, science has not
yet been able to predict with reliability the potential for activity on these or on
any other active fault.

While minor seismic activity within Sierra Madre occurs yearly without
damage, the potential for severe damage does exist with these active faults,
particularly with the Sierra Madre fault, which traverses the City.

The potential for earthquakes influences fire protection planning. A major
seismic event would create a community-wide demand on fire protection
services, which would be beyond the response capability of the Fire
Department. This potential problem can be partially mitigated by requiring
initial fire control through the installation of automatic fire protection systems.

Although the water system in Sierra Madre is rated Class 4 by the Insurance
Services Offices, with the above noted hazard, it is possible that major fire
flow requirements could be disrupted and automatic fire suppression systems
requiring much less water would be the only means of extinguishment.

TOPOGRAPHICAL

The mountains that border the north of Sierra Madre create a beautiful
backdrop, and at the same time, create a unique hazard. As one approaches
the mountains, the elevation increases, and this lengthens the response time
of emergency vehicles due to the increase in grade. Additionally, the steep,
narrow canyons create narrow winding roads that also lengthen response
times. The foothills have become prime sites for residential development
because of their scenic beauty. These same scenic hills create barriers for
accessibility by fire suppression forces.

The topographical layout of Sierra Madre’s hillside areas creates hazardous
conditions should a storm cause trees to fall and block roadways within Sierra
Madre, again making accessibility difficult until properly cleared. These
conditions have occurred in the past and have the potential to happen again.

During a fire, fire engines need to utilize the water from the many fire hydrants
found in the canyons along these narrow roads. While using these hydrants,
the access on the road is severely restricted. These conditions have occurred



in the past and have the potential to happen again. This potential problem
can be partially mitigated by requiring new roads to have additional width to
the roadway in the vicinity of fire hydrants.

Sierra Madre has areas that are in high fire hazard zones. As stated above,
due to topography, access to structures in these fire hazard zones increases
response time and delays fire suppression efforts. Extended response times
allow fires to grow beyond the control of initial attack resources. Additionally,
large structure fires in the hillside areas have a greater likelihood of starting
wildland fires, which exposes additional structures to fire.

The value of the land in Sierra Madre is near the top in the County and
maximum usage of the land is important to investors and developers. The
multi-residential zones located within Sierra Madre encourage developers to
seek maximum return on their investment. The most effective method of
achieving this is to allow maximum density. This creates buildings that
provide minimum required clearances between structures and maximum
allowable height. This results in “barriers” that hinder fire-fighting operations,
and restrict the movement of emergency personnel and equipment in the
vicinity of the structure.

STATEMENT OF THE PROBLEM

The Fire Department is charged with the task of providing a reasonable degree of fire
and life safety in Sierra Madre with minimum budget and staffing levels.

The City of Sierra Madre places a high value on protection of human life against
hazards of fire. While smoke detectors are intended to give an early warning that
allow occupants to escape or defend themselves from the hazard of fire, automatic
sprinklers are meant to control or extinguish a developing fire to enable occupants to
better escape. Sprinkler systems have been found to be highly effective systems for
the protection of human life and should be used whenever feasible.

The water supply in Sierra Madre makes extensive use of automatic sprinkler
systems feasible. Most of the City is ideally located below the 6 reservoirs, which
supply the gravity flow water system with storage capacity in excess of 6 million
gallons. Many of our fire service installations maintain static pressures in excess of
80 pounds per square inch. The City of Sierra Madre water distribution system is the
major contributing factor toward the fire suppression capabilities of the Sierra Madre
Fire Department. There are jurisdictions within the State, which have difficulty
providing required water flows for automatic fire sprinkler systems, making the
operation of such sprinkler systems less feasible than in the City of Sierra Madre.

The City of Sierra Madre is also subject to certain dangers, making the use of
automatic sprinkler systems a more significant factor in fire suppression. The City of
Sierra Madre is located in one of the most active earthquake fault systems in the
United States. Major damage corresponding to magnitude 7 or higher earthquake
can be expected. Severe seismic action would place extreme demands on the
limited resources of our small fire department. Communications could be disrupted.
Damage to gas and water mains is to be expected. As previously mentioned, the City



of Sierra Madre water system is the key to sprinkler supply. The City of Sierra Madre
water system is constructed in a grid to reduce the effect of a single pipe or area of
pipes breaking. Therefore, entire system failure due to earthquake is more unlikely
than a partial failure. Automatic fire sprinkler systems will operate on much less
pressure than normally available in Sierra Madre. Although sprinklers may only
partially control a fire, this would be important in reducing the fire problem or delayed
response that may be created by broken communications and obstructed access.
Automatic fire sprinkler systems would therefore reduce demands on firefighting
forces during emergency earthquake conditions.

The Sierra Madre Fire Department’s first alarm assignment dependent on mutual aid
companies from surrounding cities. Most jurisdictions consider three engine
companies, two truck companies a rescue squad/ambulance, and a Chief Officer to
be a minimum for a single-family structure fire.

Because Sierra Madre’s Fire Department staffing is dependent upon mutual aid
companies from other cities, it is imperative that developers and builders provide
built-in fire protection within buildings covered by the City of Sierra Madre Sprinkler
Ordinance. Unless fires are kept in their incipient stages, which automatic fire
sprinkler systems achieve, the fire department, as presently staffed and equipped
cannot function effectively against large or numerous fires. Large or numerous fires
necessitate the immediate call for mutual aid, which if available, will be delayed.

Additionally, due to the winding narrow roads that are found in our canyon areas, it is
imperative that access on these roads be maintained at all times, especially during a
fire when the fire hydrants are being used.

While the adoption of regulations may not prevent incidents of fire, the
implementation of the various regulations and/or requirements will reduce the
severity and potential loss of life and property in our community.

The serious concerns based on these “Findings”, support the imposition of built-in
fire protection requirements greater than those set forth in the International Building
and Fire Codes. Additionally, Sierra Madre Ordinance No. 1417 will provide effective
protection of the populace and property, and help reduce the ravages of fire.

The Sierra Madre Fire Department submits these “Findings” and requests
acceptance of same as defined under Section 13869.7 of the State of California
Health and Safety Code.

Prepared and submitted by:

Date

Captain Richard Snyder,
Sierra Madre Fire Marshal



John Harabedian , Mayor

John Capoccia, Mayor Pro Tem
Rachelle Arizmendt, Council Member
Denise Delmar, Council Member
Gene Goss, Council Member

City of Sierra Madre

Sue Spears, City Clerk,

A g enda Rep OI-t Mickhael Amerio City Treasurer
TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Michael Amerio, City Treasurer

Satnam Rait, Accountant
REVIEWED BY:  Gabriel Engeland, City Manager
DATE: October 22, 2019

SUBJECT: Treasurer's Report — Quarter Ending June 30, 2019

STAFF RECOMMENDATION
Receive and file the Treasurer's Report for the cash and investment portfolio for quarter
ending June 30, 2019.

SUMMARY
Attached is the 4th quarter of the Treasurer's Report for the 2018-19 fiscal year.

ANALYSIS

The fiscal officer is presenting to the City Council a quarterly treasurer's report along with
a statement that the City has sufficient investment liquidity and revenues to be able to
meet the City’'s expenditure requirements for the next three months. In addition, the
statement verifies that the investments are in compliance with the City's Statement of
Investment Policy.

Cash held in demand deposit accounts are kept at a level to ensure that all city
outstanding warrants are covered, to maximize interest income and to minimize bank
fees. Idle cash is invested in LAIF and other investments in compliance with the City's
Investment Policy.

FINANCIAL REVIEW
No fiscal impact from this action.

PUBLIC NOTICE PROCESS

This item has been noticed through the regular agenda notification process. Copies of
this report are available at the City Hall public counter, at the Sierra Madre Public Library,
and can be accessed on the City’s website at www.cityofsierramadre.com.

Attachment(s):
Treasurer's Report for April - June 2019

FOR CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM NUMBER



CITY OF SIERRA MADRE
TREASURER'S REPORT

CASH AND INVESTMENT PORTFOLIO

April - June 2019

CITY CASH
ACCOUNT INSTITUTION BALANCE RATE
ALL BAMK OF THEWEST § 1,480,921.16 0.000%
TOTAL $ 1,490,921.16
BEGINNING + 0 ENDING
ACCOUNT NAME INSTITUTION BALANGCE DEPDSITS WITHDRAWALS BALANCE
General Account BANK OF THE WEST 2,001 ,99'5.23 7,769,928.63 (8,281 !W2.75) 1,490I921.15
TOTAL § 2,001,99528 $ 7,768,92363 $ (ﬂ£81 ;002.75) $ 1,490!921.15
CITY INVESTMENT
PERCENT OF STATED
ISSUER BOOK VALUE FACE VALUE MARKET VALUE PORTFOLIO RATE
LOGAL AGENCY INVESTMENT FUND $ 11,714,169.16 § 11,714,169.16 $ 1,714,169.16 57.73% 2.428%
BANK OF THE WEST -BNP PARIBAS $ 8,485,028.12 § 8,600,000.00 § B,575,958.00 42.27% See Attached
TOTAL $ 20,199,197.28 $ 20,314,169.16 §$ 20,291,127.18 100.00%
BEGINNING * - ENDING
ISSUER BALANCE DEPOSITS WITHDRAWALS BALANCE
LOCAL AGENCY INVESTMENT FUND $ 9,£11,329.69 $ 2,652,830.47 {450,000.00) $ 11,714,189.18 2.428%
BANK OF THE WEST -BNP FPARIBAS $ 8,511,231.96 § 1,071,068.92 {1,097,272.76) § 8,485,02812 See Attached
TOTAL $ 18,022,561.65 $ 3,723,908.99 § {1,647,272.76) § 20,199,197.28
CITY - TOTAL CASH AND INVESTMENT s 21,680,118.44
FISCAL AGENT
PERCENT OF STATED
ISSUER BOOK VALUE FACE VALUE WARKET VALUE PORTFQLIO RATE
BNY MELLON 409,463.76 § 409,463.76 $ 409 463.78 100.00% 0.00%
TOTAL $ 409,463.76 §$ 409,463.76 $ 409,463.76 100.00%
[y)
+ WITHDRAWALS/
BEGINNING DEPOSITSS SALES/ ENDING STATED
ISSUER BALANGCE PURCHASES MATURITIES BALANCE RATE
BNY MELLON/ Tax 1993 Reserve Fund 407,776.60 29,250.43 (18,563.27) 409,463.76 0.00%
TOTAL H 407,776.60 $ 20,250.43 $ (18,563.27) § 409,463.78
CITY - TOTAL FISCAL AGENT $ 409,463.76

In compliance with the California Code Saction 53646, as the City Treasurer

of the City of Slerra Madrs, | hereby certify that sufficient investment liquidity
and anticipated revenues are available o mest the City's expenditure
requirements for the next alx months and that all Investments are in compliance

to the City's Statement of Investment Policy.

| also certify that this report refiects ali Government Agency pooled investments

and all City"s bank balances.

m{(QGQQQW\M Ve

Michael Amerio, Clty Treasuresr

Date



City of Sierra Madre
Treasurer's Report
Cash Balances by Fund

For the Quarter Ended June 30, 201¢

Eund Balance Balance
No. |Fund 4172019 Receipts Disbursements 513012018
10000 |General 5423494 | 4,937,187 | 3,164,403 | 7,196,187

28002 |Misc Grants B {12,198), - | - (12,198)
32XXX_|Assessment Districts 892,672 88,389 61375, 989,886
24002 |Development Impact Fees 1,405,475 - 326 491 1,078,984
34003 |Art In Public Places 59,258 - - 56,258
35003 |Police Danations ) 4,939 = =1 4,938
35004 |PSAF 248,208 | 34,700 128229 154,677 |
35005 |State COPS Grant - 260,350 2225 | 76,543 185,031
36002 |Fire Department Donations. 3581 ™| - 3,614
37001 |Community Arta Cammission 8,347 - - 6,347 |
37003 |Recreation Donations 40,461 i 704 39756
37004 |Prop A 340,548 62,415 51,165 341,797
| 37005 _[Open Space Fund {72,990) 12,395 = (60,595)
| 37008 |senior Center 199101 895 8,074 192,019
| 37007 _|SM Community Foundafion 40,883 - - 40,883
37008 |Youth Activity Center 60,173 - i B 60,173
aroo9 [PropC 164,943 | 42,959 111,365 88,837
37010 |County Prop A Park Dev - . 13,763 |  (13,763)|
| 38001 |CA Beverage Contsiner 38,947 | E -1 38,047
| 38002 |CDBG - - - - -
| 38003 |aQMD i 48,580 3718 40,153 12,153
38004 |Envivonmental Furd (48,711) 43,789 | 7463 (10,384)]
38005 |Gas Tax (80,305) 147,080 | 71,973  (5,219)
38006 [TDA Fund (1,351) 53 5991 (7.289)
38007 |Measure R 130,735 32,130 | 95513 | 67353
| 38012 |Measure M 110.786 38,337 | 70,061 77,072 |
38013 |RMRA | 118,585 | 49,936 ' 1_24,152 44,‘..’.5;9
28014 |Trafic Congestion Relief Program 24,505 -1 - 24,905
39002 |Library GiR & Memorial 253,951 357 | 1,482 252,827
39006 |Friends of the Library (12,394) 1570 12936 (9,540)
40000 |Capital Projects Fund 648,257 25,913 "119,7:_33 o 554,432
47000 _[Low & Mad Housing 2,570 - - 2,570
50001 [Debt Servics (78,820), 52,000 | - 12,380 |
50003 |Successor Agency 199.916 , - 13,648 186,267
60000 |internal Sves - Fleet 587,696 | 102,048 | 87,373 602,37¢
| 50001 |internal Sves - Facilities. 1,501,500 128,936 115,717 1,514,720
| 80002 [internal Sves - Admin 879,312 ‘ 222,348 175,007 | 926,853
60003 _|intemal Sves - Technology 973,226 | 228,900 163297 1,038,828
80007 |iS-Personnel & Risk Mgmt 2,544,256 1,324,582 1332731 2,536,107
.60003 General Plan Update 08,174 - - - 58,174
| 71000 |water 1,771,083 1,840,892 1,235,686 2,076,268
| 72000 |Sewer 1,477,225 284,789 180193 1,291,820
| 77001 |aquatis - - | 2l :
| 77003 |Special Events ) - . N N PO
77004 |Movie Details Services - - - -
TOTALS 20,024,557 9,460,872 7,795,310 21,690,118
Account Amount
Local Agency Investment Fund 11,714,168
Investments Bank of the \West - Parfbas 8,485,028
tShecking - Bank of the West 1,480,921 |

21,690,118




(z) sunr-1aao)siasys Bupop 294

yuegq A uop\FO\GTOZ-BTOZ Jeah [eosd Jof\Hoday sJamnseal 1\Sawn3og mu:mc_n_/tm._m:m/:oEEou/“N

- S

9T 1Z606V'T S
(€9'££0'S0E)

1Z2'650°CE

85'G68E9L'T $
91'126'061'T $
(zovEL'7SL'T)

ETLT6'TEY'T

SO'8EL TILT s

:asuejeq Sulpus JEpdT [eIPUSH
swiaq| Suijlipuoday Jayio
SIEMEIPYNM/SHO3YD SUIPUEISIND-
psuel] ul syusodag+

:aouepey Suipu3 Juawalels jued

:9ouejeqg Suipul J93pat e49U2D
S¥9YD/SHUGIQ/SIEMEIPYUM-
susodag+

gaue|eg Suiuuidsg 1adpal [eJausd

61,/0€/9 Bulpul pouad
159M 243 JO jued -1unoddy [EACILET 5]
uopeljipuoday Jued

aipeip eudis Jo A



City of Sierra Madre

Schedule of Investments

As of June 30, 2019

Annual
Interest
# jInvestment Purchase Maturity Amount Yield Income
1|LAIF (Estimate) Various Any time S 11,714,169 2.428%( 5 284,420
2|US Treasury 4/12/2017 10/15/2019 1,100,000 1.10% 12,100
3|Us Treasury 4/12/2017 3/31/2020 1,100,000 1.20% 13,200
4|US Treasury 10/23/2017 10/15/2020 1,100,000 1.55% 17,050
51US Treasury 10/23/2017 4/30/2021 1,000,000 1.68% 16,800
6lUS Treasury 10/23/2017 11/30/2021 1,000,000 1.75% 17,500
7[US Treasury 5/24/2018 4/30/2022 1,100,000 2.60% 28,600
8[US Treasury 11/1/2018 11/15/2022 1,100,000 2.75% 30,250
9|US Treasury 4/15/2019 5/31/2023 1,100,000 2.30% 25,300
Total S 20,314,169 S 445,220
Investment Income {llustration Investment Maturity [llustration
| Annual Maturities I
2015 S 20,000 2019 S 12,814,169
2016 $ 80,000 2020 2,200,000
Projected Future Investment Income S 445,220 2021 2,000,000
2022 2,200,000
2023 1,100,000
Total $ 20,314,169




r/—\
ACCOUNT NO. 3IE07689
CITY OF SIERRA MADRE
232 W SIERRA MADRE BLVD
SIERRA MADRE CA 91024
DDA: 041495730
SAFEXEEPING INVENTORY PAGE 1
06/30/19
CusIP RATE CALL/BUT INFORMATLON ORIBIMAL COST INFLATED PAR/ HARKET PRICE
SETTLE MATURETY SECURITY DESCRIPTION RECPT# UNIT/PAR VALUE ORISTHAL EACE HARKET VALUE
— CLASS: TRERSURY NOTES
|—
= 912828759 1.000 1,097,285.76 89, 680000000
— 0¢/12/17  10/15/1% usT 1.000 20/18/19 033521 1,100,000.00 1,096,480.00
———
= 912829784 1.375 1,105,593.53 99.512040000
— 04/12/17 03/31/20 var 1,375 63/31/20 033522 1,100, 000.00 1,094, 632.00
== 912820232 1.625 1,100,7%5.15 98, 630000000
- 10/23/17  10/15/20 usT 1.625 16/15/20 036183 1,100,000.00 1,096,400,00
912828Q78 1,275 988,258.3¢ 99,262000000
10/23/17  04/38/2) UsT 1.375 n4/30/21 036182 1,000,000.00 $92,620.00
912828U865 1.750 998,024.11 100, 031080000
10/23/1T  11/30/21 UsT 1.750 11/30/21 036182 1,008,000.00 1,000,310.00
912828347 1.875 535,910.75 10€. 402008800
04/24718  04/30/22 UST 1.875 04/30/22 038131 550, 000.080 552,211.00
91282847 1.875 535,087.26 100.402000000
05/15/18 0&/30/22 ust 1.B35 04/30/22 038568 550,000.00 §52,211.00
{CONT.)
—

BE
ol

|

Member



—
—
——
———
—
—
——
—

—
—
——
————,
—
—_

BANKWEST
BNP PARIBAS

ACCOUNT NO. SIE0768%9

£ITY OF SIERRA HADRE
232 W SIERRA MADRE BIVD

SIERRA MADRE CA 91024
DDA: 041495730
SAFEKEEPING INVENTORY BAGE 2
06/30/19
CusIP RATE CALL/PUT INFORMATION ORIGIMRL COST IRELATED PAR/ MARKET PRICE
SETTLE MATURITY SECURITY DESCRIPTEON RECPTH# UNIT/PAR VALUE ORIGINAL FACE MARKET VALUE
A12928TT6 1.625 ~2,053,004.30~ 99. 668000000
A1/01718 34715722 ysT A:62% 11/15/22 Q40527 L1,100,000.00 A,096,348.00
912828R69 1.625 1,071,068.92 99, 6060040000
0442318 08/31/23 UsT 1.625 05/31/23 042704 1,100,000.00 1,095,666.00
ORIGIKAL COBT 8,485,028.12
CLASS TOTAL: UNITS/CURRENT FACE 8,600,000.00 MARKET VALUE 8,576,958,00
GRAND TUTAL: ORIGINAL COST A4S, bee.12

GRAND TOTRL: UNITS/CURRENT FACE

D

=
%

87 606,000.00 MARKET VALUE

9,576,958.00

|



CITY

ST ERERA

oF

CANYON

J

§ DAREY
& CANYON
£ WILDERNESS
| PARK
% AURLRN RES.

P a2
s

5 . i
i {1 F f,‘.
I [ | _MomsteRy ' ! E T
Rt £ I
by R ! i 2 jr==="
H A \‘ 3 § WSTERIA ‘% W
1y 2~ 2|
it Y
by !
¥ & 5
i & 1 )
H \.‘ BAILEY s i
" -.,\QMON \ /// /
il W Park s
ooy SRS S /
1 WE,
g I A
O : e
REY it
STk bR, %" W, Mk R i WOTE
&
- ' W, ALEORIA REL | g ALEGHIA ST, RITA'S
6 .CATHOLC
) SCHOOL
i W, GRANDVIEW .
gt i , : ASCENSION d d
§ i 3 d PARISH =
s =l %
_ E_ GAUREL WE,
T i ACADEMY - b SIERRA MESA 5 ;
y g é NETORIA LANE = SCHOOL :
:] il ﬂ |
W, HGHLAND R = i !
e I
" & l ‘
%]1 z E . L= ;‘"% I
<l E = U t
! W, HOHTEND o ) D; E;. HIGHRLAHD e |2 ]
e r—— A, | £y WHNTECRD W, = oy
El & ; il === -7 FooL 3
= " g t o NONTECITD AV i O 3
i , = § i N 2 % ; seRms vsra |
I N . 2 }
:]I " W SERFA  MADRE Lo, SIERRA WADRE : Lo NOT TG SCALE
el Y ¥ - '
Ty
;‘ | E:J ] ] GIViC PARK g gl s b g A §
u !‘5 “ 3 = pANTER = SR, WHITA 2 !
g e ANTAMTA R, I
R R —tﬂ 3 SUFFOLK ' !I L/gﬁdgé‘ g El
) 5. POST SAN__ GABRIEL Omp‘!fe?” § YONT €T,
- ;1 [S SFFICK i e et ™ e i g
= ESFERANZA W, g TOAL N : SiH GapA, [iA |
: RAGHL AVE, ] S M, g I !
- . l RS
5 g 2NN | R §
% i agmui - § 2 § 2 5: ; oo _: :,__,,_ =
-— v & \
g : == 4 A | I I CITY OF SIERRA MADRE
Pt - 5 g
v 5 . o z % a : %H ASSOCITED TRIFFIC CONSULTANTS DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
' ) 2 M g " X I TRASPOTTEN, PG & DREERNG =
— o L — S -~ = p—— vy — 4 g S— — i — e ’w&_“'—-ﬁﬁ @“ﬂimuom“ﬁ s
T 2 oF N 1T tl v T — i ) i CITY MAP
oo m _mm._& ot wn Ll RE,
st o L
CL. ] [scaLE: [

PR



ccimino
Pencil

ccimino
Pencil

ccimino
Pencil

ccimino
Pencil

ccimino
Line

ccimino
Line

ccimino
Line

ccimino
Pencil

ccimino
Pencil


John Harabedian, Mayor

John Capoccia, Mayor Pro Tem
Rachelle Arizmendi, Council Member
Denise Delmar, Council Member
Gene Goss, Council Member

City of Sierra Madre

Sue Spears, City Clerk,

Agenda Report Michael Amerio City Treasurer
TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of the City Council
FROM: Chris Cimino, Director of Public Works
REVIEWED BY: Gabriel Engeland, City Manager
DATE: October 22, 2019
SUBJECT: AWARD THE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES CONTRACT TO WEST

AND ASSOCIATES FOR ENGINEERING DESIGN SERVICES FOR
THE DESIGN OF FY 2019-20 STREET IMPROVEMENTS

STAFF RECOMMENDATION

Staff recommends that the City Council award a professional services contract to West and Associates
Engineering INC. for engineering design service in the amount of $45,500 and authorize the Public
Works Director to execute the Professional Services Agreement with said firm.

SUMMARY

The Public Works Department has received proposals for professional civil engineering services
associated with the preparation of plans, specifications and estimates (PS&E) for the FY 2019-20 Street
Improvement Project. Staff recommends that the City Council award a contract to West and Associates
Engineering INC. in an amount not-to-exceed $45,500 for professional civil engineering services for
the FY 2019-20 Street Improvement Project.

ANALYSIS
The Fiscal Year 2019-20 Street Resurfacing Project has been defined as including:
Streets Limits
Auburn Avenue Sierra Madre Boulevard to Grandview Avenue
East/West Highland Avenue Auburn Avenue to Mt. Trail Avenue
Santa Anita Court Mountain Trail Avenue to Holdman Avenue
South Canon Place Santa Anita Court to End
Oak Meadow Place Santa Anita Court to End
East Grandview Avenue Baldwin Avenue to Canon Avenue
Acacia Street Foothill Avenue to End




Page 2 of 3

Valle Vista Drive Acacia Street to Acacia Street

A Request for Proposals for design of the plans, specifications and estimates was issued by Public Works
staff and posted on the City’s website. 12 Engineering and geotechnical firms downloaded the RFP. four
proposals were received from firms throughout Southern California.

West and Associates $45,500
RKA Consulting Group $45,680
CNC Engineering $78,139
Quantum consulting $78,345

West and Associates Engineering INC. is the lowest bidder and the favorable bidder through the
qualification evaluation process. The RFP’s were evaluated and scored by staff determining their
corporate qualifications, project approach and fee schedule. Staff contacted the City of Blythe and City
of Laguna Niguel and Lake Arrowhead Community Services District for a reference. Staff did not get a
chance to speak with Laguna Niguel before this report was completed. However, The City of Blythe and
Lake Arrowhead both said West and Associates were timely and their reports were professional. They
completed their task on time with no changes that raised the cost of the project. Staff believes West and
Associates Engineering INC. is capable of completing the current project in a timely manner. Staff
therefore recommends utilizing West and Associates Engineering INC. for the design of the FY 2019-
20 Street Improvement Project.

FINANCIAL REVIEW/SOURCE OF FUNDING

Project funding shall be from the city’s SB 1, Measure R, Prop C, and Measure M funds. With
carry overs from last fiscal year’s street projects and this year’s allocations the FY 2019-20 Street
reconstruction Project funds equal $825,800. The following is the breakdown of these funds.

City Council Street resurfacing set-aside  (CIP) $160,000
Proposition C (37009.85000) $159,400
Measure M $156,700
Measure R $138,300
RMRA (SB-1) $181,800
Total street resurfacing funds available $796,200

In addition to the street resurfacing funding above, the following amounts are available for
replacement of damaged sidewalk, construction of new sidewalk, and replacement or new curb
access ramps. This will allow for the addition of sidewalk/ramp work to the project without
reduction of in-roadway improvements.

TDA Funds (38002.83600) $29,600

Total Available Street Project Funding $825,800

PUBLIC NOTICE PROCESS
This item has been noticed through the regular agenda notification process. Copies of this report




Page 3 of 3

are available at the City Hall public counter, at the Sierra Madre Public Library, and can be
accessed on the City’s website at www.cityofsierramadre.com.

Attachments
Project Map


http://www.cityofsierramadre.com/

RESOLUTION NUMBER 19-54

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SIERRA MADRE
APPROVING CERTAIN DEMANDS

WHEREAS, the following demands have been reviewed and approved by the
Finance Director; and,

WHEREAS, the Finance Director has verified that appropriated funds are
available for payment thereof; and,

WHEREAS, the register of audited demands has been submitted to the City
Council for approval; and

WHEREAS, City Warrants are the payment of bills, invoices and contractual
obligations incurred by the City of Sierra Madre during the period enumerated therein,
based on the approved fiscal year budget and existing budgetary authority, Municipal
Code authority, or prior policy direction by the City Council; and

WHEREAS, Payroll Transfer is the transfer of funds to cover the payroll costs for
all City employees for the period enumerated therein.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the City Council of the City of Sierra
Madre does hereby ratify payment of City Warrants in the aggregate amount of
$979,730.07; Sierra Madre Library Warrants in the aggregate amount of $3,929.60; and
Payroll Transfer in the aggregate amount of $355,105.61 for the fiscal year ending

June 30, 2020.

APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 22™ day of October, 2019.

Mayor, City of Sierra Madre, California
| hereby certify that the foregoing Resolution Number 19-54 was adopted by the City
:(Z)S;chil of the City of Sierra Madre at a regular meeting held on the 22" day of October,
AYES:

NOES:
ABSTAIN:

ABSENT:

City Clerk, City of Sierra Madre, California



City of Sierra Madre
Department of Finance
Warrant Register Recap
City Council Meeting of October 22, 2019

CITY OF SIERRA MADRE AND SIERRA MADRE LIBRARY

City of Sierra Madre Warrants ... $979,730.07
Sierra Madre Library Warrants. .. ...........ccooii e, $3,929.60
Payroll

AN O . - oot e e e e et e e e $355,105.61



Warrant Register 10/22/19

Attachment 1A

Fiscal Year Description Armount Page #
FY1920 Manual Warrants 8,334.90 1-2
FY1920 Manual Warrants 223.40 3
FY1920 General Warrants 965,240.53 4-8
FY1920 General Warrants - Utility Bills 5,931.24 9

Total 979,730.07
FY1920 Library Warrants 3,929.60 10
Total 3,929.60
Date:

10/22/2019|Payroll #21 Electronic Tansfers

$355,105.61

To: City of Sierra Madre-Payroll Acct.

From: City of Sierra Madre-General Acct.

Total

355,105.61




Check Approval Register
City of Sierra Madre, CA
Page 1

Packet: APPKT04779 - MANUAL CHECK 10/22/19 Check Date: 10/09/2019
\Vendor Set: 01 - Vendor Set 01
Vendor Number Vendor Name Vendor Total
Bank Code Payment Type invoice # Invoice Description Account Number Distribution Amount
0823 BANK OF AMERICA 8,334.90
APBWEST Check INV025572 CC ELEMENTS FOR STEAM TABLE 60001.83200.53200 369.50
INV025573 CC STAFF APPRECIATION EVENT 60007.70100.53403 121.81
INV025574 CC FURNITURE FOR CHAMBER 60001.83200.53200 84.65
INVD25575 CC STACKING CHAIRS 60001.83200.53200 448.48
INV(Q25576 CC MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES 50001.83200.52301 640.00
INVO25577 CC VEHICLE MAINTENANCE 60000.83100.53208 24.95
INV0O25578 CC VEHICLE MAINTENANCE 60000.83100.53208 18.95
INV025579 VG APA CONFERENCE 10000.40000.53402 380.05
INVO25580 VG APA CONFERENCE 10000.40000.53402 580.90
INVD25581 HG SGVC MEETING 60002.30000.53402 30.00
INV0255382 JH VEHICLE MAINTEANCE 10000.50000.52302 9.00
INV025583 JH LACPCA STRATEGIC MEETING 10000.50000.53402 133.82
INVO25584 JH DEPARTMENT SUPPLIES 10000.50000.53301 24.68
INV0Q25585 JH MEETING WITH CORPORAL ONDORDONK 10000,50000.53999 35.13
INV025586 JH VEHICLE MAINTENANCE 10000.50000.52302 9.00
INV025587 JH VEHICLE MAINTENANCE 10000.50000.52302 9.00
INVD25588 JH VEHICLE MAINTENANCE 10000.50000.52302 9.00
INVQ25589 JH PD INTERVIEW PANEL MEETING 60007.70100.53999 76.01
INV025590 JH TITLE 15 TRAINING COURSE 10000.50000.52005 133.00
INV025591 JHTITLE 15 TRAINING COURSE 10000.50000.52005 3.66
INV025592 CK 5GV CHAPTER MEMBERSHIP 60002.30000.53409 55.00
INV025593 CK SGV MEETING & CONFERENCE 60002.30000.53402 30.00
INVD25594 KN FIRE CHIEF'S ANNUAL CONFERENCE 10000.61000.53402 750.00
INV025595 JR SMALL TOOLS 71000.81100.53205 88.18
INV025596 JR PW STAFF MEETING 71000.81100.53402 35.74
INV025597 IR PW STAFF MEETING 71000.81100.53402 34.86
INV025598 JRSMALL TOOLS 71000.81100.53205 54.70
INV(025599 JR FLEET PART FOR UNIT 60000.83100.53208 98.00
INVO25600 JR MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES 71000.81100.53200 304.52
INVD25601 RS SENIOR EXCURSION 10000.79003.5299% 390.00
INVO25602 RS SENIOR CRAFTS 37006.72000,53999 21.91
INYD25603 RS STAFF RECOGNITION EVENT 60007.70100.53403 47.84
INV(025604 RS STAFF RECOGNITION EVENT 60007,70100.53403 19.17
INVD25605 RS STAFF RECOGNITION EVENT 60007.70100.53403 11.52
INVO25606 RS SENIOR MOVIE EVENT 37006.72000.53599 1.53
INV(25607 RS SENIOR ACTIVITY 37006.72000.53999 40.98
INVD25608 CS TEEN VOLUNTEER EVENT 39006.50000.53999 29.18
INVO25603 CS ADULT CRAFT 39006.90000.53995 39.67
INV025610 CS TEEN VOLUNTEER EVENT 39006.90000.53999 173.41
INV325611 CS ALA POSTER TEEN BOARD 10000.90000.53999 34.30
INV025612 CS CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.50000.53402 40.00
INV025613 CS CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INV025614 €5 CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INV025615 CS CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INV(25616 CS CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INV025617 €S CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INV025618 €S CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INVD25619 CS CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INV025620 CS$ CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INVD25621 CS CLA CONFERENCE STAFF MEMBERSHIP 10000.90000.53402 40.00
INV025622 CS CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 150.00
INV025623 CS CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE  10000.90000.53402 150.00
INV025624 CS CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 150.00

10/9/201% 3:30:20 PM

Page 1 of 3



Packet: APPKT04779 - MANUAL CHECK 10/22/19 Check Date: 10/09/2019
Vendor Set: 01 - Vendor Set 01

Page 2
Vendor Number Vendor Name Vendor Total

Bank Code Payment Type Inveice # Invoice Description Account Number Distribution Amount
APBWEST Check INV025625 CS CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 220.00
INVD25626 €S CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 150.00

INV025627 €S CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSQC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 150.00

INV025628 CS CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 150.00

INV025629 CS CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 150.00

INV025630 €S CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 150.00

INV025631 €S CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 150.00

INV025632 €S CALIFORNIA LIBRARY ASSOC. CONFERENCE 10000.90000.53402 165.00

INVD25633 CS HAY FOR SCARECROW 39006.90000.53955 13.00

INV025634 CS WORKSHOP TRAINING 10000.90000.52205 59.00

INVO25635 GE CITY MANAGERS CONFERENCE 60002,30000.53402 725.00

Report Total: 8,334.90

10/9/2019 3:30:20 PM Page 2 of 3



City of Sierra Madre, CA

Packet: APPKT04785 - MANUAL CHECK 10/22/19
Vendor Set: 01 - Vendor Set 01

Vendor Number Vendor Name

Bank Code Payment Type Invoice #
1497 MOUNTAIN VIEWS NEWS
APBWEST Check CM140597

Invoice Description

FY 2019-20 PUBLICATION OF NOTICES

Check Approval Register

Page 3

Check Date: 10/10/2019

Vendor Total
Account Number Distribution Amount
223.40
10000.12000.52206 223.40
Report Total: 223.40

10/16/2019 12:08:32 PM

Page 1 of 2



Packet:
Vendor Set:

Vendor Number
Bank Code
010!

APBWEST

1O

(o]

43

(IS}

APBWEST

VENO3251
APBWEST

VEND2961
APBWEST

155

APBWEST

L\=}

155

(J¥]

APBWEST

012

L]

APBWEST

City of Sierra Madre, CA

APPKT(4794 - GEN 10/22/19
01 - Vendor Set 01

Vendor Name
Payment Type
AIRGAS USA

Check 16016317438

Invoice #

ALLSTAR FIRE EQUIPMENT, INC.
Check 218807

218837
AMERICAN REIVER BENEFIT ADMINISTRATORS
Check INV025648

Invoice Description

FY 2019-2020 MEDICAL OXYGEN
FY 2019-2020 MEBICAL OXYGEN

FY 2019-2020 SUPPRESSION EQUIPMENT
FY 2019-2020 SUPPRESSION EQUIPMENT

FF INSURANCE OCT & NOV 2019

ARAMARK UNIFORM & CAREER APPAREL GROUP INC

Check 000534355253

534583502
ARNOLD'S FRONTIER HARDWARE - Fire
Check 092524

Check 92703

092752
ARNOLD'S FRONTIER HARDWARE - PW
Check 091597
091676
091715
091742

FY 19/20 lanitorial
FY 19/20 Uniform

FY 2019-2020 HARDWARE SUPPLIES
FY 2019-2020 HARDWARE SUPPLIES
FY 2019-2020 HARDWARE SUPPLIES
FY 2019-2020 HARDWARE SUPPLIES
FY 2019-2020 HARDWARE SUPPLIES
FY 2019-2020 HARDWARE SUPPLIES
FY 2019-2020 HARDWARE SUPPLIES
FY 2019-2020 HARDWARE SUPPLIES

Hardware Supplies
CM RETURN
Hardware Supplies

FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Street

FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Street

FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Street

FY 19/20 Street

FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Park Supplies

FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Street

FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 15/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies

Check Approval Register

Account Number

10000.64000.53300
10000.64000.53300

10000.61000.53300
10000.61000.53300

10000.61000.53409

60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53303

10000.61000.53204
10000.61000.53204
10000.61000.53204
10000.61000.53204
10000.61000.53204
10000.61000.53204
10000.61000.53204
10000.61000.53204

10000.50000.53204
10000.50000.53204
10000.50000.53204

60001.83200.53200
10000.83500.53206
60001.83200.53200
10000.83500.53206
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
10000.83500.53206
10000.83500.53206
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
10000.83300.53001
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
10000.83500.53206
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
71000.81100.53200
60001.83200.53200
71000.81100.53200
71000.81100.53200
71000.81100.53200
71000.81100.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200

Page 4

Check Date: 10/16/2019

Vendor Total
Distribution Amount
74.01
18.86
55.15
826.84
413.42
413.42
392.84
392.84
386.04
293.15
92.89
83.39
9.94
3.82
4,33
10.59
8.75
15.35
16.40
14.21
14.75
43.79
-43,79
14,75
1,190.72
5.68
3173
33.93
31.16
55.25
14.22
16.40
10.94
65.44
6.56
22.96
49.26
23.28
8.74
3.26
7.67
2517
4.92
10,51
30.64
7.11
16.40
18.89
4.35
13.41
7.61
6.26
58.78
13.12

10/16/2019 i:4%:16 PM

Page 1 of 7



Packet:
Vendor Set:

Vendor Number
Bank (Sng
APBWEST

0125
APBWEST
VENQ3209

APBWEST

VENGZ2889
APBWEST

VENO3440
APBWEST

VENO2212
APBWEST

1487
APBWEST

VEND2208
APBWEST

=]

32

{#3}

APBWEST
1121
APBWEST

1167
APBWEST
VEND2871
APBWEST
0185
APBWEST
1428
APBWEST
VEN03084

APBWEST

APPKT04794 - GEN 10/22/19
01 - Vendor Set 01

Vendor Name

invoice Description

FY 19/20 Street

FY 19/20 Street

FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Street

FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Street

FY 18/20 Street

FY 18/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 15/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 18/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Water Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies
FY 19/20 Facilities Supplies

VEHICLE MAINTENANCE

YAC Bldg Elevator repair Deposit

Account Number
"10000.83500.53206
10000.83500.53206
60001.83200.53200
10000.83500.53206
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
71000.81100.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
71000.81100.53200
10000.83500.53206
10000.83500.53206
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
71000.81100.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200
71000.81100.53200
60001.83200.53200
71000.81100.53200
71000.81100.53200
60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200

60000.83100.53208

37010.85200.56010

YAC Bldg Elevator repair Production Release w/ | 37010.85200.56010

FY 15-20 BPO- SMPD AVTEC RADIO CONSOLE

2019 Water Main Replacement Project
RETENTION: 5% OF COMPLETED WORK

customization of 2017 Chevy Volt
VEHICLE MAINTENANCE

PERMIT VALUATION
MAINTENANCE OF TRAFFIC

FY 19-20 LEGAL SV CS-RETAINER
LEGAL SERVICES SEPT 2019
LEGAL SERVICES SEPT 2019
LEGAL SERVICES SEPT 2019
LEGAL SERVICES SEPT 2019
LEGAL SERVICES SEPT 2019
LEGAL SERVICES SEPT 2019
LEGAL SERVICES SEPT 2019

FY 19/20 Sierra Madre Production Services
1GB DATA PLAN OCT 2019

POLYGRAPH EXAMINATIONS

RETIREE HEALTH INSURANCE NOV 2019

Payment Type Invoice #

Check 09-5554
092655
092662
092664
052665
092666
092692
092697
092713
092718
092740
092741
092757
092787
092798
092810
082340
092849
092857
092860
092863
092869
092876
092935

ARROW AUTOMOTIVE SERVICE

Check i042333

ARROW LIFT OF CALIFORNIA

Check 20191001dn8
20191001pr7

AVTEC, INC

Check 35435

BIG BEN ENGINEERING

Check 1
1b

BLACK & WHITE EMERGENCY VEHICLES

Check 3241

BB WONDRIES FORD

Check 1198606

CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

Check INVO25654

CITY OF PASADENA

Chack 30008946

COLANTUONQO, HIGHSMITH & WHATLEY, PC

Check 40342
40342b
40343
40344
40345
40346
40347
40348

COMMUNITY MEDIA OF THE FOOTHILLS

Check 414

CYBERREEF SOLUTIONS INC

Check 3677

D. F. POLYGRAPH

Check 2019/8

DAN GINTER

Check INVD25640

DAVID SPERNOW/DEVLYNE NETWOQRKS LLC

Check CoSMO12

PD SERVER SUPPORT

10000.50000.52200

71000.81100.56011
71000.00000.23500

60000.83100.53208
60000.83100.53208
16000.00000.23207
10000.83500.52001
10000.21000,52201
10000.21000.52201
60007.70100.52201
10000.21000.52201
32006.83000.52200
71000.81100.52201
10000.81201.52202
71000.81100.52201
60003.20000.52100
10000.50000.52200
60007.70101.52100

60007.70100.51302

60003.30000.52100

Check Date: 10/16/2019

Page 5

Vendor Total
Distribution Amaount
6.92
20.75
20.12
4,37
31.17
10.93
17.88
109.48
6.54
7.16
9.84
13.12
3.29
5.78
22.47
3.26
64.75
33.36
23.15
62.32
16.85
13.13
16.43
64.00
20.00
40.00
30,787.56
13,194.67
17,592.89
8,963.00
8,963.00
767,313.10
807,698.00
-40,384.90
4,178.95
4,178.95
210.19
210.19
101.00
101.00
2,547.16
2,547.16
14,034.64
10,500.00
16.24
499.50
2,278.00
282.00
141.00
140.90
177.00
2,400.94
2,400.94
299.78
299.78
525.00
525.00
356.50
356.50
990.00
990.00

10/16/2019 1:49:16 PM

Page 2 of 7



Invoice Description

SEISMIC HAZARDMAPPING FEE

DHCS QUALITY ASSURANCE FEE Q2 2018
State related items JULY 2019

REFUND

VEHICLE MAINTENANCE
VEHICLE MAINTENANCE

DSA JULY/2015-SEPT/2019

MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES

FY 19/20 Monthly Janitorial Services

CRIME SCENE CLEANING

VEHICLE MAINTENANCE

EQUIPMENT

BACKUP INTERNET SVCS 11/1/19-11/30/19

FY 19/20 Elevator Maintenance
FY 19/20 Elevator Maintenance

LASERCARE HP MFP
BACKGROUND SCREENING
GOVERNMENTAL MEMBERSHIP
CODE ENFORCEMENT TRAINING

PHYSICAL EXAM

RETIREE HEALTH INSURANCE NOV 2019
RETIREE HEALTH INSURANCE NGOV 2019

FY 19/20 CITY ENGINEER SERVICES
FY19/20 CITY ENGINEER RETAINER

POLO UNIFORM
POLO UNIFORM

BLOOD EXAM

LEGAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AUG 2019
EMPLOYEE TRAINING HR DEPT

FY 2019-2020 EMS SUPPLIES

RETIREE HEALTH INSURANCE NOV 2019

Packet: APPKT04794 - GEN 10/22/19
Vendor Set: 01 - Vendor Set 01
Vendor Number Vendor Name
Bank Code Payment Type Invoice #
1681 DEPT OF CONSERVATION
APBWEST Check INV025655
VENO3 272 DEPT OF HEALTH CARE SERVICES
APBWEST Check GEM1119Y4A2
0713 DEPT OF JUSTICE
APBWEST Check 396217
VENO3460 DIANE MARQUEZ
APBWEST Check INVQ25652
VENO3180 DICKS AUTO SUPPLY
APBWEST Check 174535
174702
VENQ1935 DIVISION OF THE STATE ARCHITECT
APBWEST Check INV025569
VEND3194 DOUG'S SPRAYING AND FERTILIZING SERVICE
APBWEST Check 4020
VENQZ997 DYNAMIC BUILDING MAINT INC
APBWEST Check 25
1649 EMERGENCY RESPONSE CRIME SCENE CLEANING
APBWEST Check T2019-422
1510 GARVEY EQUIPMENT CO.
APBWEST Check 123070
123156
VEMND3086 GC PIVOTAL LLC
APBWEST Check INV2668830
1639 GMS ELEVATOR SERVICES INC
APBWEST Check 98367
98470
VENG3195 GREATAMERICA FINANCIAL SERVICES
APBWEST Check 25620831
1359 HIRERIGHT, LLC
APBWEST Check HO172164
1477 1cC
APBWEST Check 3244711
VENO1412 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL INC
APBWEST Check 1001098825
0913 IRWINDALE INDUSTRIAL CLINIC
APBWEST Check 2130-92G580
1044 JESSE TORIBIO
APBWEST Check INV025642
1156 JCGHN FORD
APBWEST Check INV025638
0387 KEVORK TCHARKHOUTIAN
APBWEST Check 2019-090
2019-09R
i348 LANDS' END BUSLNESS OUTFITTERS
APBWEST Check SIN7825678
SINY830467
VENO1628 LAW ENFORCEMENT MEDICAL SERVICES, INC
APBWEST Check 14654
0277 LIEBERT CASSIDY WHITMORE
APBWEST Check 1485555
1708 LIEBERT CASSIDY WHITMORE
APBWEST Check INV025643
0640 LIFE-ASSIST INC.
APBWEST Check 944810
VENO1660 LISA VOLPE
APBWEST Check INV025639

Account Number

10000.00000.23206

10000.64000.52001

10000.50000.52200

10000.00000.21007

71000.00000.21007

72000.00000.21007

60000.83100.53208
60000.83100.53208

10000.00000.23400

60001.83200.53200

60001.83200.52200

10000.50000.52006

60000.83100.53208

10000.83500.53205

10000.83600.53211

60003.320000.52200

60001.83200.52200
60001.83200.52200

60003.30000.53210

60007.70101.52100

10000.40000.53409

10000.40000.53409

60007.70100.52106
60007.70101.52100

60007.70100.51302

60007.70100.51302

10000.82000.52100
10000.82000.52100

60007.70100.53303
60007.70100.53300

10000.50000.53304

60007.70100.52201

60007.70100.52205

10000.64000.53300

60007.70100.51302

Check Date: 10/16/2019
Page 6

Vendor Total

Distribution Amount
162.83

162.83
2,659.14

2,659.14
594.00

594.00
1,136.99

82.45

904.19

150,35
328.09

175.23

152.86
67.60

67.60
148.00

148.00
2,919.00

2,919.00
450.00

450.00
1,871.96

11.56

750.00

1,110.40
1,557.52

1,557.52
712.50

£25.00

87.50
1,875.13

1,875.13
47.25

47.25
135.00

135.00
165.00

165.00
1,075.00

220.00

855.00
178.25

178.25
249.55

249.55
3,040.00

2,240.00

800.00
228.27

37.17

191.10
75.00

75.00
1,591.50

1,591.50
86.00

86.00
415.07

415.07
285.20

285.20

10/16/2019 1:49:16 PM

Page 3 of 7



Invoice Description
KERSTING COURT PROJECT
ELECTION SUPPLIES

FY 19/20 Landscape Services SEPT 2019

FY 2019-20 POSTAGE REFILL

OFFICE SUPPLIES
OFFICE DEPOT

OFFICE SUPPLIES
OFFICE SUPPLIES

REFUND
OFFICE SUPPLIES

FY 19-20 BPO- ANIMAL CONTROL SERVICE

VEHICLE MAINTENANCE

Account Number

37010.85000.56002

10000.12000.52207

10000.81201.52200
10000.83300.52200
32002.83000.52200
32008.83000.52200
60001.83200.52200

60002.320000.53101

60002.30000.53100
60002.30000.53100
60007.70100.53101
60002.30000.53100
60002.30000.53100
60007.70100.53300
60002.30000.53100
60002.30000.53100

10000.50000.52004

60000.83100.53208

FY 19-20 BPO- PARKING CITATION SERVICE AUG 10000.50000.52200

FY 19/20 Fuel Purchase
FY 19/20 Fuel Purchase

City Hall Doors - access control system

TELEPHONE OCT 2019

60000.83100.55001
60000.83100.55001

60001.83200.56002

10000.50000.55005

Y 19/20 Document Scanning and Archive Servic 10000.40000.52200
FY 19/20 Document Scanning and Archive Servic 10000.40000.52200

PLUMBING SUPPLIES
PLUMBING SUPPLIES

RETIREE HEALTH INSURANCE NQV 2019

Hard Drives

PD INTERVIEW PANEL

FY19-20 BPO- MAILING AND WATER BILLING

RETIREE HEALTH INSURANCE NOV 2019

60001.83200.53200
60001.83200.53200

60007.70100.51302

60003.30000.56010

60007.70100.5395%

71000.32000.53101

60007.70100.51302

FY 19-20 BPO- COUNTY FEES DISTRIBUTION AUC 10000.50000.52200

FY 2019-20 EMS AND SUPPRESSION UNIFORMS 10000.61000.53303

MONTHL<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>